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Federal Communications Commission § 80.513 

and located on a shipyard regularly en-
gaged in construction or repair of com-
mercial transport vessels or Govern-
ment vessels are authorize to commu-
nicate between stations when they are 
licensed to the same entity and com-
munications are limited to serving the 
needs of ships on a non-interference 
basis to other stations in the maritime 
mobile service. A separate showing is 
required. 

§ 80.507 Scope of service. 

(a) A private coast station or marine 
utility station using telephony serves 
the operational and business needs of 
ships including the transmission of 
safety communication. 

(b) In areas where environmental 
communications are provided by U.S. 
Government stations or by public coast 
stations, private coast stations and 
marine utility stations on shore must 
not duplicate that service. In other 
areas, private coast stations and ma-
rine utility stations on shore may 
transmit weather and hydrographic in-
formation required for the ships with 
which they normally communicate. 
Private coast stations may provide en-
vironmental communication service in 
areas where adequate service is not 
available. 

(c) Each marine utility station on 
shore must be operated as a private 
coast station except that it may be op-
erated at temporary unspecified loca-
tions. Marine utility stations on ships 
are operated as ship stations. 

(d) Each private coast station is au-
thorized by rule to use hand-held ma-
rine radios in the vicinity of the sta-
tion’s fixed transmitter site on those 
frequencies assigned to the private 
coast station. Hand-held communica-
tions must conform to those normally 
permitted under a marine utility sta-
tion authorization and must be limited 
to contact with the associated private 
coast station and ship stations in the 
vicinity of the private coast station. 

[51 FR 31213, Sept. 2, 1986, as amended at 62 
FR 40307, July 28, 1997] 

§ 80.509 Frequency assignment. 

Frequencies assignable to private 
coast stations and marine utility sta-
tions are listed in subpart H. 

§ 80.513 Frequency coordination. 
(a) Except as provided in paragraphs 

(b) and (c) of this section each applica-
tion for a new VHF private coast sta-
tion license or modification of an exist-
ing license to be located in an area 
having a recognized frequency coordi-
nating committee must be accom-
panied by: 

(1) A report based on a field study, in-
dicating the degree of probable inter-
ference to existing stations operating 
in the same area. The applicant must 
consider all stations operating on the 
working frequency or frequencies re-
quested or assigned within 80 km (50 
miles) of the proposed station location, 
and 

(2) The report must include a state-
ment that all existing licensees on the 
frequency within 80 km (50 miles) and 
the frequency coordinating committee 
have been notified of the applicant’s 
intention to file an application. The 
notice of intention to file must provide 
the licensees concerned and the advi-
sory committee with the following in-
formation: The frequency and emis-
sion; transmitter location and power; 
and the antenna height proposed by the 
applicant. 

(b) Applications for modification 
need not be accompanied by the field 
study where the modification does not 
involve any change in frequency(ies), 
power, emission, antenna height, an-
tenna location or area of operation. 

(c)(1) In lieu of the field study, the 
applicant may acquire a statement 
from a frequency coordinating com-
mittee. The applicant must certify on 
the application concerning the rec-
ommendations of the coordinating 
committee. The committee must com-
ment on the requested frequency or the 
proposed changes in the authorized sta-
tion and give an opinion regarding the 
probable interference to existing sta-
tions. The committee must consider all 
stations operating on the requested fre-
quency within 80 km (50 miles) of the 
proposed station location. The fre-
quency coordinating committee state-
ment must also recommend a fre-
quency which will result in the least 
amount of interference to proposed and 
existing stations. Committee rec-
ommendations may also include com-
ments on technical factors and may 
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