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measured with the frequency sweep 
stopped, along with spurious emissions 
generated from the sweeping signal, 
must be attenuated below the peak car-
rier power (in watts) as follows: 

(1) On any frequency more than 5 Hz 
from the instantaneous carrier fre-
quency, at least 3 dB; 

(2) On any frequency more than 250 
Hz from the instantaneous carrier fre-
quency, at least 40 dB; and 

(3) On any frequency more than 7.5 
kHz from the instantaneous carrier fre-
quency, at least 43 + 10log10 (peak 
power in watts) db. 

[62 FR 40307, July 28, 1997] 

§ 80.231 Technical Requirements for 
Class B Automatic Identification 
System (AIS) equipment. 

(a) Class B Automatic Identification 
System (AIS) equipment must meet 
the technical requirements of IEC 
62287–1 (incorporated by reference, see 
§ 80.7). 

(b) In addition to the labels or other 
identifying information required under 
§§ 2.925 and 2.926 of this chapter, each 
Class B AIS device shall include a con-
spicuous label that includes: Instruc-
tions on how to accurately enter into 
the device and confirm static data per-
taining to the vessel in which the de-
vice is or will be installed; and the fol-
lowing statement: ‘‘WARNING: It is a 
violation of the rules of the Federal 
Communications Commission to input 
an MMSI that has not been properly 
assigned to the end user, or to other-
wise input any inaccurate data in this 
device.’’ Instructions on how to accu-
rately enter and confirm static data in 
the device shall also be included in the 
user’s manual for the device. The entry 
of static data into a Class B AIS device 
shall be performed by the vendor of the 
device or by an appropriately qualified 
person in the business of installing ma-
rine communications equipment on 
board vessels. In no event shall the 
entry of static data into a Class B AIS 
device be performed by the user of the 
device or the licensee of a ship station 
using the device. Knowingly program-
ming a Class B AIS device with inac-
curate static data, or causing a Class B 
AIS device to be programmed with in-
accurate static data, is prohibited. 

(c) Prior to submitting a certifi-
cation application for a Class B AIS de-
vice, the following information must 
be submitted in duplicate to 
typeapproval@uscg.mil or the Com-
mandant (CG–ENG–4), U.S. Coast 
Guard Stop 7509, 2703 Martin Luther 
King Jr. Ave. SE., Washington, DC 
20593–7509: 

(1) The name of the manufacturer or 
grantee and the model number of the 
AIS device; and 

(2) Copies of the test report and test 
data obtained from the test facility 
showing that the device complies with 
the environmental and operational re-
quirements identified in IEC 62287–1. 

(d) After reviewing the information 
described in paragraph (c) of this sec-
tion, the U.S. Coast Guard will issue a 
letter stating whether the AIS device 
satisfies all of the requirements speci-
fied in IEC 62287–1. 

(e) A certification application for an 
AIS device must contain a copy of the 
U.S. Coast Guard letter stating that 
the device satisfies all of the require-
ments specified in IEC 62287–1, a copy 
of the technical test data, and the in-
struction manual(s). 

[74 FR 5124, Jan. 29, 2009, as amended at 76 
FR 67612, Nov. 2, 2011; 81 FR 90746, Dec. 15, 
2016] 

§ 80.233 Technical requirements for 
Automatic Identification System 
Search and Rescue Transmitters 
(AIS–SART) equipment. 

(a) Automatic Identification System 
Search and Rescue Transmitter (AIS– 
SART) equipment must meet the tech-
nical requirements of IEC 61097–14 and 
IMO Resolution MSC.246(83) (incor-
porated by reference, see § 80.7(b)). 

(b) Prior to submitting a certifi-
cation application for an AIS–SART 
device, the following information must 
be submitted in duplicate to the U.S. 
Coast Guard, 2703 Martin Luther King 
Jr. Ave. SE., Stop 7126, Washington, DC 
20593–7126: 

(1) The name of the manufacturer or 
grantee and the model number of the 
AIS–SART device; and 

(2) Copies of the test report and test 
data obtained from the test facility 
showing that the device complies with 
the environmental and operational re-
quirements identified in IEC 61097–14. 
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(c) After reviewing the information 
described in paragraph (b) of this sec-
tion, the U.S. Coast Guard will issue a 
letter stating whether the AIS–SART 
device satisfies all of the requirements 
specified in IEC 61097–14. 

(d) A certification application for an 
AIS–SART device must contain a copy 
of the U.S. Coast Guard letter stating 
that the device satisfies all of the re-
quirements specified in IEC 61097–14, a 
copy of the technical test data, and the 
instruction manual(s). 

[81 FR 90747, Dec. 15, 2016] 

Subpart F—Equipment Authoriza-
tion for Compulsory Ships 

§ 80.251 Scope. 

(a) This subpart gives the general 
technical requirements for certifi-
cation of equipment used on compul-
sory ships. Such equipment includes 
automatic-alarm-signal keying de-
vices, survival craft radio equipment, 
radar equipment and Ship Security 
Alert System (SSAS) equipment. 

(b) The equipment described in this 
subpart must be certificated. 

(c) The term transmitter means the 
transmitter unit and all auxiliary 
equipment necessary to make this unit 
operate as a main or emergency trans-
mitter in a ship station at sea. Each 
separate motor-generator, rectifier, or 
other unit required to convert the ship 
primary power to the phase, frequency, 
or voltage necessary to energize the 
transmitter unit is considered a com-
ponent of the transmitter. 

(d) Average ship station antenna means 
an actual antenna installed on board 
ship having a capacitance of 750 pico-
farads and an effective resistance of 4 
ohms at a frequency of 500 kHz, or an 
artificial antenna having the same 
electrical characteristics. 

[51 FR 31213, Sept. 2, 1986, as amended at 63 
FR 36606, July 7, 1998; 68 FR 46966, Aug. 7, 
2003; 73 FR 4483, Jan. 25, 2008; 76 FR 67612, 
Nov. 2, 2011] 

§ 80.268 Technical requirements for ra-
diotelephone installation. 

All radiotelephone installations in 
radiotelegraph equipped vessels must 
meet the following conditions. 

(a) The radiotelephone transmitter 
must be capable of transmission of A3E 
or H3E emission on 2182 kHz and must 
be capable of transmitting clearly per-
ceptible signals from ship to ship dur-
ing daytime, under normal conditions 
over a range of 150 nautical miles when 
used with an antenna system in accord-
ance with paragraph (c) of this section. 
The transmitter must: 

(1) Have a duty cycle which allows 
for transmission of the radiotelephone 
alarm signal described in § 80.221. 

(2) Provide 25 watts carrier power for 
A3E emission or 60 watts peak power 
on H3E emission into an artificial an-
tenna consisting of 10 ohms resistance 
and 200 picofarads capacitance or 50 
ohms nominal impedance to dem-
onstrate compliance with the 150 nau-
tical mile range requirement. 

(3) Have a visual indication whenever 
the transmitter is supplying power to 
the antenna. 

(4) Have a two-tone alarm signal gen-
erator that meets § 80.221. 

(5) This transmitter may be con-
tained in the same enclosure as the re-
ceiver required by paragraph (b) of this 
section. These transmitters may have 
the capability to transmit J2D or J3E 
transmissions. 

(b)(1) The radiotelephone receiver 
must receive A3E and H3E emissions 
when connected to the antenna system 
specified in paragraph (c) this section 
and must be preset to 2182 kHz. The re-
ceiver must additionally: 

(i) Provide an audio output of 50 
milliwatts to a loudspeaker when the 
RF input is 50 microvolts. The 50 mi-
crovolt input signal must be modulated 
30 percent at 400 Hertz and provide at 
least a 6 dB signal-to-noise ratio when 
measured in the rated audio band-
width. 

(ii) Be equipped with one or more 
loudspeakers capable of being used to 
maintain a watch on 2182 kHz at the 
principal operating position or in the 
room from which the vessel is normally 
steered. 

(2) This receiver may be contained in 
the same enclosure as the transmitter 
required by paragraph (a) of this sec-
tion. These receivers may have the ca-
pability to receive J2D or J3E trans-
missions. 
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