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(2) The final amplifier stage of an 
analog transmitter modified for digital 
operation shall not have an ‘‘average 
digital power’’ output greater than 25 
percent of its previous NTSC peak sync 
power output, unless the amplifier has 
been specifically refitted or replaced to 
operate at a higher power. 

(3) Analog heterodyne translators, 
when modified for digital operation, 
will produce a power output (digital av-
erage power over the 6 MHz channel) 
not exceeding 30 watts for transmitters 
operating on channels 14–69 and 3 watts 
for transmitters operating on channels 
2–13. 

(4) After completion of the modifica-
tion, suitable tests and measurements 
shall be made to demonstrate compli-
ance with the applicable requirements 
in this section including those in 
§ 74.795. Upon installation of a field 
modification kit, the transmitter shall 
be performance-tested in accordance 
with the manufacturer’s instructions. 

(5) The station licensee shall notify 
the Commission upon completion of 
the transmitter modifications. In the 
case of custom modifications (those 
not related to installation of manufac-
turer-supplied and FCC-certificated 
equipment), the licensee shall certify 
compliance with all applicable trans-
mission system requirements. 

(6) The licensee shall maintain with 
the station’s records for a period of not 
less than two years the following infor-
mation and make this information to 
the Commission upon request: 

(i) A description of the modifications 
performed and performance tests or, in 
the case of installation of a manufac-
turer-supplied modification kit, a de-
scription of the nature of the modifica-
tions, installation and test instruc-
tions and other material provided by 
the manufacturer; 

(ii) Results of performance-tests and 
measurements on the modified trans-
mitter; and 

(iii) Copies of related correspondence 
with the Commission. 

(c) In connection with the on-channel 
conversion of existing analog transmit-
ters for digital operation, a limited al-
lowance is made for transmitters with 
final amplifiers that do not meet the 
attenuation of the Simple emission 
mask at the channel edges. Station li-

censees may obtain equivalent compli-
ance with this attenuation require-
ment in the following manner: 

(1) Measure the level of attenuation 
of emissions below the average digital 
power output at the channel edges in a 
500 kHz bandwidth; measurements 
made over a different measurement 
bandwidth should be corrected to the 
equivalent attenuation level for a 500 
kHz bandwidth using the formula given 
in § 74.794; 

(2) Calculate the difference in dB be-
tween the 46 dB channel-edge attenu-
ation requirement of the Simple mask; 

(3) Subtract the value determined in 
the previous step from the authorized 
effective radiated power (‘‘ERP’’) of 
the analog station being converted to 
digital operation. Then subtract an ad-
ditional 6 dB to account for the approx-
imate difference between analog peak 
and digital average power. For this 
purpose, the ERP must be expressed in 
decibels above one kilowatt: ERP(dBk) 
= 10 log ERP(kW); 

(4) Convert the ERP calculated in the 
previous step to units of kilowatts; and 

(5) The ERP value determined 
through the above procedure will 
produce equivalent compliance with 
the attenuation requirement of the 
simple emission mask at the channel 
edges and should be specified as the 
digital ERP in the minor change appli-
cation for an on-channel digital con-
version. The transmitter may not be 
operated to produce a higher digital 
ERP than this value. 

[69 FR 69336, Nov. 29, 2004] 

§ 74.797 Biennial Ownership Reports. 

The Ownership Report for Commer-
cial Broadcast Stations (FCC Form 323) 
must be electronically filed by Decem-
ber 1 in all odd-numbered years by each 
licensee of a low power television sta-
tion or other Respondent (as defined in 
§ 73.3615(a) of this chapter). A licensee 
or other Respondent with a current and 
unamended biennial ownership report 
(i.e., a report that was filed pursuant to 
this subsection) on file with the Com-
mission that is still accurate and 
which was filed using the version of 
FCC Form 323 that is current on Octo-
ber 1 of the year in which its biennial 
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ownership report is due may electroni-
cally validate and resubmit its pre-
viously filed biennial ownership report. 
The information provided on each own-
ership report shall be current as of Oc-
tober 1 of the year in which the owner-
ship report is filed. For information on 
filing requirements, filers should refer 
to § 73.3615(a) of this chapter. 

[82 FR 55772, Nov. 24, 2017] 

§ 74.798 Digital television transition 
notices by broadcasters. 

(a) Each low power television, TV 
translator and Class A television sta-
tion licensee or permittee must air an 
educational campaign about the transi-
tion from analog broadcasting to dig-
ital television (DTV). 

(b) Stations that have already termi-
nated analog service and begun oper-
ating in digital prior to effective date 
of this rule shall not be subject to this 
requirement. 

(c) Stations with the technical abil-
ity to locally-originate programming 
must air viewer notifications at a time 
when the highest number of viewers is 
watching. Stations have the discretion 
as to the form of these notifications. 

(d) Stations that lack the technical 
ability to locally-originate program-
ming, or find that airing of viewer no-
tifications would pose some sort of a 
hardship, may notify their viewers by 
some other reasonable means, e.g. pub-
lication of a notification in a local 
newspaper. Stations have discretion as 
to the format and time-frame of such 
local notification. 

[76 FR 44829, July 27, 2011] 

§ 74.799 Low power television and TV 
translator channel sharing. 

(a) Channel sharing generally. (1) Sub-
ject to the provisions of this section, 
low power television and TV translator 
stations may voluntarily seek Commis-
sion approval to share a single six 
megahertz channel with other low 
power television and TV translator sta-
tions, Class A television stations, and 
full power television stations. 

(2) Each station sharing a single 
channel pursuant to this section shall 
continue to be licensed and operated 
separately, have its own call sign and 
be separately subject to all of the Com-

mission’s obligations, rules, and poli-
cies. 

(b) Licensing of channel sharing sta-
tions. The low power television or TV 
translator channel sharing station re-
linquishing its channel must file an ap-
plication for the initial channel shar-
ing construction permit, include a copy 
of the channel sharing agreement as an 
exhibit, and cross reference the other 
sharing station(s). Any engineering 
changes necessitated by the channel 
sharing arrangement may be included 
in the station’s application. Upon initi-
ation of shared operations, the station 
relinquishing its channel must notify 
the Commission that it has terminated 
operation pursuant to § 73.1750 of this 
part and each sharing station must file 
an application for license. 

(c) Deadline for implementing channel 
sharing arrangements. Channel sharing 
arrangements submitted pursuant to 
this section must be implemented 
within three years of the grant of the 
initial channel sharing construction 
permit. 

(d) Channel sharing agreements. (1) 
Channel sharing agreements (CSAs) 
submitted under this section must con-
tain provisions outlining each licens-
ee’s rights and responsibilities regard-
ing: 

(i) Access to facilities, including 
whether each licensee will have unre-
strained access to the shared trans-
mission facilities; 

(ii) Allocation of bandwidth within 
the shared channel; 

(iii) Operation, maintenance, repair, 
and modification of facilities, includ-
ing a list of all relevant equipment, a 
description of each party’s financial 
obligations, and any relevant notice 
provisions; 

(iv) Transfer/assignment of a shared 
license, including the ability of a new 
licensee to assume the existing CSA; 
and 

(v) Termination of the license of a 
party to the CSA, including reversion 
of spectrum usage rights to the re-
maining parties to the CSA. 

(2) CSAs must include provisions: 
(i) Affirming compliance with the 

channel sharing requirements in para-
graph (d)(1) of this section and all rel-
evant Commission rules and policies; 
and 
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