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47 CFR Ch. I (10–1–20 Edition) § 74.1269 

§ 74.1269 Familiarity with FCC rules. 
Each licensee or permittee of a sta-

tion authorized under this subpart 
shall be familiar with those rules relat-
ing to stations authorized under this 
subpart. Copies of the Commission’s 
Rules may be obtained from the Super-
intendent of Documents, Government 
Publishing Office, Washington, DC 
20401, or accessed online at https:// 
www.ecfr.gov or https://www.gpo.gov/ 
fdsys/browse/ 
collectionCfr.action?collectionCode=CFR. 

[83 FR 13683, Mar. 30, 2018] 

§ 74.1281 Station records. 
(a) The licensee of a station author-

ized under this Subpart shall maintain 
adequate station records, including the 
current instrument of authorization, 
official correspondence with the FCC, 
maintenance records, contracts, per-
mission for rebroadcasts, and other 
pertinent documents. 

(b) Entries required by § 17.49 of this 
chapter concerning any observed or 
otherwise known extinguishment or 
improper functioning of a tower light: 

(1) The nature of such extinguish-
ment or improper functioning. 

(2) The date and time the extinguish-
ment of improper operation was ob-
served or otherwise noted. 

(3) The date, time and nature of ad-
justments, repairs or replacements 
made. 

(c) The station records shall be main-
tained for inspection at a residence, of-
fice, or public building, place of busi-
ness, or other suitable place, in one of 
the communities of license of the 
translator or booster, except that the 
station records of a booster or trans-
lator licensed to the licensee of the pri-
mary station may be kept at the same 
place where the primary station 
records are kept. The station records 
shall be made available upon request to 
any authorized representative of the 
Commission. 

(d) Station logs and records shall be 
retained for a period of two years. 

[48 FR 44807, Sept. 30, 1983, as amended at 84 
FR 2759, Feb. 8, 2019] 

§ 74.1283 Station identification. 
(a) The call sign of an FM broadcast 

translator station will consist of the 

initial letter K or W followed by the 
channel number assigned to the trans-
lator and two letters. The use of the 
initial letter will generally conform to 
the pattern used in the broadcast serv-
ice. The two letter combinations fol-
lowing the channel number will be as-
signed in order and requests for the as-
signment of particular combinations of 
letters will not be considered. 

(b) The call sign of an FM booster 
station or LPFM booster will consist of 
the call sign of the primary station fol-
lowed by the letters ‘‘FM’’ or ‘‘LP’’ and 
the number of the booster station 
being authorized, e.g., WFCCFM–1 or 
WFCCLP–1. 

(c) A translator station authorized 
under this subpart shall be identified 
by one of the following methods. 

(1) By arranging for the primary sta-
tion whose station is being rebroadcast 
to identify the translator station by 
call sign and location. Three such iden-
tifications shall be made during each 
day: once between 7 a.m. and 9 a.m., 
once between 12:55 p.m. and 1:05 p.m. 
and once between 4 p.m. and 6 p.m. Sta-
tions which do not begin their broad-
cast before 9 a.m. shall make their first 
identification at the beginning of their 
broadcast days. The licensee of an FM 
translator whose station identification 
is made by the primary station must 
arrange for the primary station li-
censee to keep in its file, and to make 
available to FCC personnel, the trans-
lator’s call letters and location, giving 
the name, address and telephone num-
ber of the licensee or his service rep-
resentative to be contacted in the 
event of malfunction of the translator. 
It shall be the responsibility of the 
translator licensee to furnish current 
information to the primary station li-
censee for this purpose. 

(2) By transmitting the call sign in 
International Morse Code at least once 
each hour. Transmitters of FM broad-
cast translator stations of more than 1 
watt transmitter output power must be 
equipped with an automatic keying de-
vice that will transmit the call sign at 
least once each hour, unless there is in 
effect a firm agreement with the trans-
lator’s primary station as provided in 
§ 74.1283(c)(1) of this section. Trans-
mission of the call sign can be accom-
plished by: 
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(i) Frequency shifting key; the car-
rier shift shall not be less than 5 kHz 
nor greater than 25 kHz. 

(ii) Amplitude modulation of the FM 
carrier of at least 30 percent modula-
tion. The audio frequency tone use 
shall not be within 200 hertz of the 
Emergency Broadcast System Atten-
tion signal alerting frequencies. 

(d) FM broadcast booster stations 
shall be identified by their primary 
stations, by the broadcasting of the 
primary station’s call signs and loca-
tion, in accordance with the provisions 
of § 73.1201 of this chapter. 

(e) The Commission may, in its dis-
cretion, specify other methods of iden-
tification. 

[55 FR 50699, Dec. 10, 1990, as amended at 85 
FR 35574, June 11, 2020] 

§ 74.1284 Rebroadcasts. 
(a) The term rebroadcast means the 

reception by radio of the programs or 
other signals of a radio station and the 
simultaneous retransmission of such 
programs or signals for direct recep-
tion by the general public. 

(b) The licensee of an FM translator 
shall not rebroadcast the programs of 
any AM or FM broadcast station or 
other FM translator without obtaining 
prior consent of the primary station 
whose programs are proposed to be re-
transmitted. The Commission shall be 
notified of the call letters of each sta-
tion rebroadcast and the licensee of the 
FM translator shall certify that writ-
ten consent has been received from the 
licensee of the station whose programs 
are retransmitted. 

(c) An FM translator is not author-
ized to rebroadcast the transmissions 
of any class of station other than an 
AM or FM broadcast station or another 
FM translator. 

[35 FR 15388, Oct. 2, 1970, as amended at 74 FR 
45130, Sept. 1, 2009] 

§ 74.1290 [Reserved] 
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