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upon request. Eligible telecommuni-
cations carriers must maintain the 
documentation required in §§ 54.404 
(b)(11), 54.410(b), 54.410 (c), 54.410(d), and 
54.410(f) for as long as the subscriber re-
ceives Lifeline service from that eligi-
ble telecommunications carrier, but for 
no less than the three full preceding 
calendar years. 

(b) Prior to the effective date of the 
rules, if an eligible telecommuni-
cations carrier provides Lifeline dis-
counted wholesale services to a re-
seller, it must obtain a certification 
from that reseller that it is complying 
with all Commission requirements gov-
erning the Lifeline and Tribal Link Up 
program. Beginning on the effective 
date of the rules, the eligible tele-
communications carrier must retain 
the reseller certification for the three 
full preceding calendar years and pro-
vide that documentation to the Com-
mission or Administrator upon request. 

(c) Non-eligible telecommunications 
carrier resellers that purchased Life-
line discounted wholesale services to 
offer discounted services to low-income 
consumers prior to the effective date of 
the rules, must maintain records to 
document compliance with all Commis-
sion requirements governing the Life-
line and Tribal Link Up program for 
the three full preceding calendar years 
and provide that documentation to the 
Commission or Administrator upon re-
quest. 

[80 FR 40935, July 14, 2015] 

§ 54.419 Validity of electronic signa-
tures. 

(a) For the purposes of this subpart, 
an electronic signature, defined by the 
Electronic Signatures in Global and 
National Commerce Act, as an elec-
tronic sound, symbol, or process, at-
tached to or logically associated with a 
contract or other record and executed 
or adopted by a person with the intent 
to sign the record, has the same legal 
effect as a written signature. 

(b) For the purposes of this subpart, 
an electronic record, defined by the 
Electronic Signatures in Global and 
National Commerce Act as a contract 
or other record created, generated, 
sent, communicated, received, or 

stored by electronic means, constitutes 
a record. 

[77 FR 12974, Mar. 2, 2012] 

§ 54.420 Low income program audits. 
(a) Independent audit requirements for 

eligible telecommunications carriers. Eli-
gible telecommunications carriers 
identified by USAC must obtain a 
third-party biennial audit of their com-
pliance with the rules in this subpart. 
Such engagements shall be agreed upon 
performance attestations to assess the 
company’s overall compliance with the 
rules in this subpart and the company’s 
internal controls regarding the regu-
latory requirements in this subpart. 

(1) Eligible telecommunications car-
riers will be selected for audit based on 
risk-based criteria developed by USAC 
and approved by the Office of Managing 
Director and the Wireline Competition 
Bureau. 

(2) The initial audit must be com-
pleted one year after the Commission 
issues a standardized audit plan out-
lining the scope of the engagement and 
the extent of compliance testing to be 
performed by third-party auditors and 
shall be conducted every two years 
thereafter, unless directed otherwise 
by the Commission. The following min-
imum requirements shall apply: 

(i) The audit must be conducted by a 
licensed certified public accounting 
firm that is independent of the carrier. 

(ii) The engagement shall be con-
ducted consistent with government ac-
counting standards (GAGAS). 

(3) The certified public accounting 
firm shall submit to the Commission 
any rule interpretations necessary to 
complete the biennial audit, and the 
Administrator shall notify all firms 
subject to the biennial audit require-
ment of such requests. The audit issue 
will be noted, but not held as a nega-
tive finding, in future audit reports for 
all carriers subject to this requirement 
unless and until guidance has been pro-
vided by the Commission. 

(4) Within 60 days after completion of 
the audit work, but prior to finaliza-
tion of the report, the third party audi-
tor shall submit a draft of the audit re-
port to the Commission and the Ad-
ministrator, who shall be deemed au-
thorized users of such reports. Final-
ized audit reports must be provided to 
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the Commission, the Administrator, 
and relevant states and Tribal govern-
ments within 30 days of the issuance of 
the final audit report. The reports will 
not be considered or deemed confiden-
tial. 

(5) Delegated authority. The Wireline 
Competition Bureau and the Office of 
Managing Director have delegated au-
thority to perform the functions speci-
fied in paragraphs (a)(2) and (a)(3) of 
this section. 

(b) Audit requirements for new eligible 
telecommunications carriers. After a 
company is designated for the first 
time in any state or territory, the Ad-
ministrator will audit that new eligible 
telecommunications carrier to assess 
its overall compliance with the rules in 
this subpart and the company’s inter-
nal controls regarding these regulatory 
requirements. This audit should be 
conducted within the carrier’s first 
twelve months of seeking federal low- 
income Universal Service Fund sup-
port, unless otherwise determined by 
the Office of Managing Director. 

[77 FR 12974, Mar. 2, 2012, as amended at 77 
FR 38534, June 28, 2012; 81 FR 33094, May 24, 
2016; 84 FR 71329, Dec. 27, 2019] 

§ 54.422 Annual reporting for eligible 
telecommunications carriers that 
receive low-income support. 

(a) In order to receive support under 
this subpart, an eligible telecommuni-
cations carrier must annually report: 

(1) The company name, names of the 
company’s holding company, operating 
companies and affiliates, and any 
branding (a ‘‘dba,’’ or ‘‘doing-business- 
as company’’ or brand designation) as 
well as relevant universal service iden-
tifiers for each such entity by Study 
Area Code. For purposes of this para-
graph, ‘‘affiliates’’ has the meaning set 
forth in section 3(2) of the Communica-
tions Act of 1934, as amended; and 

(2) Information describing the terms 
and conditions of any voice telephony 
service plans offered to Lifeline sub-
scribers, including details on the num-
ber of minutes provided as part of the 
plan, additional charges, if any, for toll 
calls, and rates for each such plan. To 
the extent the eligible telecommuni-
cations carrier offers plans to Lifeline 
subscribers that are generally available 
to the public, it may provide summary 

information regarding such plans, such 
as a link to a public Web site outlining 
the terms and conditions of such plans. 

(b) In order to receive support under 
this subpart, a common carrier that is 
designated as an eligible telecommuni-
cations carrier under section 214(e)(6) 
of the Act and does not receive support 
under subpart D of this part must an-
nually provide: 

(1) Detailed information on any out-
age in the prior calendar year, as that 
term is defined in 47 CFR 4.5, of at 
least 30 minutes in duration for each 
service area in which the eligible tele-
communications carrier is designated 
for any facilities it owns, operates, 
leases, or otherwise utilizes that poten-
tially affect 

(i) At least ten percent of the end 
users served in a designated service 
area; or 

(ii) A 911 special facility, as defined 
in 47 CFR 4.5(e). 

(iii) Specifically, the eligible tele-
communications carrier’s annual re-
port must include information detail-
ing: 

(A) The date and time of onset of the 
outage; 

(B) A brief description of the outage 
and its resolution; 

(C) The particular services affected; 
(D) The geographic areas affected by 

the outage; 
(E) Steps taken to prevent a similar 

situation in the future; and 
(F) The number of customers af-

fected. 
(2) The number of complaints per 

1,000 connections (fixed or mobile) in 
the prior calendar year; 

(3) Certification of compliance with 
applicable minimum service standards, 
as set forth in § 54.408, service quality 
standards, and consumer protection 
rules; 

(4) Certification that the carrier is 
able to function in emergency situa-
tions as set forth in § 54.202(a)(2). 

(c) All reports required by this sec-
tion must be filed with the Office of the 
Secretary of the Commission, and with 
the Administrator. Such reports must 
also be filed with the relevant state 
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