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records supporting the entries in this 
account for income and custom work 
shall be maintained with sufficient 
particularity to identify separately the 
revenue and costs associated with each 
undertaking. 

(b) Return on investment for the use 
of regulated property plant and equip-
ment to provide nonregulated products 
and services. 

(c) All gains and losses resulting 
from the exchange of foreign currency. 
Transaction (realized) gains or losses 
shall be measured based on the ex-
change rate in effect on the trans-
action date. Unrealized gains or losses 
shall be measured based on the ex-
change rate in effect at the balance 
sheet date. 

(d) Gains or losses resulting from the 
disposition of land or artworks. 

(e) Charges or credits, as appropriate, 
to record the results of transactions, 
events or circumstances which are of 
an operational nature, but occur irreg-
ularly or are peripheral to the major or 
central operations of the company and 
not provided for elsewhere. 

[67 FR 5698, Feb. 6, 2002] 

§ 32.7199 Content of accounts. 
The Operating Tax accounts shall in-

clude the taxes arising from the cen-
tral operations of the company. 

§ 32.7200 Operating taxes. 
Companies shall use this account for 

operating taxes of the type and char-
acter detailed in Accounts 7210 through 
7250. 

[82 FR 20843, May 4, 2017] 

§ 32.7210 Operating investment tax 
credits—net. 

(a) This account shall be charged and 
Account 4320, Unamortized Operating 
Investment Tax Credits—Net, shall be 
credited with investment tax credits 
generated from qualified expenditures 
related to regulated operations which 
the company defers rather than recog-
nizes currently in income. 

(b) This account shall be credited and 
Account 4320 shall be charged ratably 
with the amortization of each year’s 
investment tax credits included in Ac-
count 4320 for investment services for 
ratemaking purposes. Such amortiza-

tion shall be determined in relation to 
the period of time used for computing 
book depreciation on the property with 
respect to which the tax credits relate. 

[51 FR 43499, Dec. 2, 1986, as amended at 67 
FR 5698, Feb. 6, 2002] 

§ 32.7220 Operating Federal income 
taxes. 

(a) This account shall be charged and 
Account 4070, Income Taxes-Accrued, 
shall be credited for the amount of 
Federal Income Taxes for the current 
period. This account shall also reflect 
subsequent adjustments to amounts 
previously charged. 

(b) Taxes should be accrued each 
month on an estimated basis and ad-
justments made as later data becomes 
available. 

(c) Tax credits, other than invest-
ment tax credits, if normalized, shall 
be recorded consistent with the ac-
counting for investment tax credits 
and shall be amortized to income as di-
rected by this Commission. 

(d) No entries shall be made to this 
account to reflect interperiod tax allo-
cations. 

§ 32.7230 Operating state and local in-
come taxes. 

(a) This account shall be charged and 
Account 4070, Income Taxes—Accrued, 
shall be credited for the amount of 
state and local income taxes for the 
current period. This account shall also 
reflect subsequent adjustments to 
amounts previously charged. 

(b) Taxes should be accrued each 
month on an estimated basis and ad-
justments made as later data becomes 
available. 

(c) No entries shall be made to this 
account to reflect interperiod tax allo-
cations. 

§ 32.7240 Operating other taxes. 

(a) This account shall be charged and 
Account 4080, Other Taxes—Accrued, 
shall be credited for all taxes, other 
than Federal, state and local income 
taxes and payroll related taxes, related 
to regulated operations applicable to 
current periods. Among the items in-
cludable in this account are property, 
gross receipts, franchise and capital 
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