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will then collect payments from over-
lay licensees. It shall also provide addi-
tional financial information as re-
quested by the Bureau to satisfy the 
Commission’s oversight responsibil-
ities and/or agency specific/govern-
ment-wide reporting obligations. 

(b) Relocation Coordinator criteria. The 
Relocation Coordinator must be able to 
demonstrate that it has the requisite 
expertise to perform the duties re-
quired, which will include: 

(1) Coordinating the schedule for 
clearing the band; 

(2) Performing engineering analysis, 
as necessary to determine necessary 
earth station migration actions; 

(3) Assigning obligations, as nec-
essary, for earth station migrations 
and filtering; 

(4) Coordinating with overlay licens-
ees throughout the transition process; 

(5) Assessing the completion of the 
transition in each PEA and deter-
mining overlay licensees’ ability to 
commence operations; and 

(6) Mediating scheduling disputes. 
(c) Relocation Coordinator duties. The 

Relocation Coordinator shall: 
(1) Establish a timeline and take ac-

tions necessary to migrate and filter 
incumbent earth stations to ensure un-
interrupted service during and fol-
lowing the transition. 

(2) Review the Transition Plans filed 
by all eligible space station operators 
and recommend any changes to those 
plans to the Commission to the extent 
needed to ensure a timely transition. 

(3) To the extent that incumbent 
earth stations are not accounted for in 
eligible space station operators’ Tran-
sition Plans, the Relocation Coordi-
nator must include those incumbent 
earth stations in an Earth Station 
Transition Plan. 

(i) May require each associated space 
station operator to file the information 
needed for such a plan with the Reloca-
tion Coordinator. 

(ii) Will describe and recommend the 
respective responsibility of each party 
for earth station migration obligations 
in the Earth Station Transition Plan 
and assist incumbent earth stations in 
transitioning including, for example, 
by installing filters or hiring a third 
party to install such filters to the ex-
tent necessary. 

(4) Coordinate its operations with 
overlay licensees. 

(5) Be responsible for receiving notice 
from earth station operators or other 
satellite customers of any disputes re-
lated to comparability of facilities, 
workmanship, or preservation of serv-
ice during the transition and shall sub-
sequently notify the Wireless Tele-
communications Bureau of the dispute 
and provide recommendations for reso-
lution. 

(6) Must make real time disclosures 
of the content and timing of and the 
parties to communications, if any, 
from or to applicants to participate in 
the competitive bidding, as defined by 
§ 1.2105(c)(5)(i) of this chapter whenever 
the prohibition in § 1.2105(c) of this 
chapter applies to competitive bidding 
for licenses in the 3.7 GHz Service. 

(7) Incumbent space station operators 
must cooperate in good faith with the 
Relocation Coordinator throughout the 
transition. 

(d) Status reports. On a quarterly 
basis, beginning December 31, 2020, the 
Relocation Coordinator must provide a 
report on the overall status of clearing 
efforts. 

(e) Document requests. The Wireless 
Telecommunications Bureau, in con-
sultation with the Office of Managing 
Director, may request any documenta-
tion from the Relocation Coordinator 
necessary to provide guidance or carry 
out oversight. 

§ 27.1414 Relocation Payment Clear-
inghouse. 

A Relocation Payment Clearinghouse 
shall be selected and serve to admin-
ister the cost-related aspects of the 
transition in a fair, transparent man-
ner, pursuant to Commission rules and 
oversight, to mitigate financial dis-
putes among stakeholders, and to col-
lect and distribute payments in a time-
ly manner for the transition of the 
3700–4000 MHz band to the 3.7 GHz Serv-
ice. 

(a) Selection process. (1) A search com-
mittee will select the Relocation Pay-
ment Clearinghouse. The search com-
mittee shall consist of member ap-
pointed by each of following nine enti-
ties: ACA Connects, Intelsat, SES, 
Eutelsat S.A., National Association 
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Broadcasters, National Cable Tele-
vision Association, CTIA, Competitive 
Carriers Association, and WISPA. 

(2) The search committee shall con-
vene no later than June 22, 2020 and 
shall notify the Commission of the de-
tailed selection criteria for the posi-
tion of Relocation Payment Clearing-
house no later than June 1, 2020. Such 
criteria must be consistent with the 
qualifications, roles, and duties of the 
Relocation Payment Clearinghouse 
specified in this subpart. The Wireless 
Telecommunications Bureau (Bureau) 
is directed, on delegated authority, to 
issue a Public Notice notifying the 
public that the search committee has 
published criteria, outlining submis-
sion requirements, and providing the 
closing dates for the selection of the 
Relocation Payment Clearinghouse and 
source (i.e., web page). 

(3) The search committee should pro-
ceed by consensus; however, if a vote 
on selection of a Relocation Payment 
Clearinghouse is required, it shall be 
by a majority. 

(4) In the event that the search com-
mittee fails to select a Relocation Pay-
ment Clearinghouse and to notify the 
Commission by July 31, 2020, the search 
committee will be dissolved without 
further action by the Commission. In 
the event that the search committee 
fails to select a Clearinghouse and to 
notify the Commission by July 31, 2020, 
two of the nine members of the search 
committee will be dropped therefrom 
by lot, and the remaining seven mem-
bers of the search committee shall se-
lect a Clearinghouse by majority vote 
by August 14, 2020. 

(5) During the course of the Reloca-
tion Payment Clearinghouse’s tenure, 
the Commission will take such meas-
ures as are necessary to ensure timely 
compliance, including, should it be-
come necessary, issuing subsequent 
public notices to select new Relocation 
Payment Clearinghouses(s). 

(b) Selection criteria. (1) The Reloca-
tion Payment Clearinghouse must be a 
neutral, independent entity with no 
conflicts of interest (organizational or 
personal) on the part of the organiza-
tion or its officers, directors, employ-
ees, contractors, or significant sub-
contractors. 

(i) Organizational conflicts of inter-
est means that because of other activi-
ties or relationships with other enti-
ties, the Relocation Payment Clearing-
house, its contractors, or significant 
subcontractors are unable or poten-
tially unable to render impartial serv-
ices, assistance or advice; the Reloca-
tion Payment Clearinghouse’s objec-
tivity in performing its function is or 
might be otherwise impaired; or the 
Relocation Payment Clearinghouse 
might gain an unfair competitive ad-
vantage. 

(ii) Personal conflict of interest 
means a situation in which an em-
ployee, officer, or director of the Relo-
cation Payment Clearinghouse, the Re-
location Payment Clearinghouse’s con-
tractors or significant subcontractors 
has a financial interest, personal activ-
ity, or relationship that could impair 
that person’s ability to act impartially 
and in the best interest of the transi-
tion when performing their assigned 
role, or is engaged in self-dealing. 

(2) The Relocation Payment Clear-
inghouse must be able to demonstrate 
that it has the requisite expertise to 
perform the duties required, which will 
include collecting and distributing re-
location and accelerated relocation 
payments, auditing incoming and out-
going estimates, mitigating cost dis-
putes among parties, and generally act-
ing as clearinghouse. 

(3) The search committee should en-
sure that the Relocation Payment 
Clearinghouse meets relevant best 
practices and standards in its oper-
ation to ensure an effective and effi-
cient transition. First, the Relocation 
Payment Clearinghouse should be re-
quired, in administering the transition, 
to: 

(i) Engage in strategic planning and 
adopt goals and metrics to evaluate its 
performance; 

(ii) Adopt internal controls for its op-
erations; 

(iii) Utilize enterprise risk manage-
ment practices; and 

(iv) Use best practices to protect 
against improper payments and to pre-
vent fraud, waste and abuse in its han-
dling of funds. The Relocation Pay-
ment Clearinghouse must be required 
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to create written procedures for its op-
erations, using the Government Ac-
countability Office’s Green Book to 
serve as a guide in satisfying such re-
quirements. 

(4) The search committee must also 
ensure that the Relocation Payment 
Clearinghouse adopts robust privacy 
and data security best practices in its 
operations, given that it will receive 
and process information critical to en-
suring a successful and expeditious 
transition. 

(i) When the prohibition in § 1.2105(c) 
of this chapter applies to competitive 
bidding for licenses in the 3.7 GHz serv-
ice, the Relocation Payment Clearing-
house must make real time disclosures 
of the content and timing of and the 
parties to communications, if any, 
from or to applicants to participate in 
the competitive bidding, as defined by 
§ 1.2105(c)(5)(i) of this chapter. 

(ii) The Relocation Payment Clear-
inghouse should also comply with, on 
an ongoing basis, all applicable laws 
and Federal Government guidance on 
privacy and information security re-
quirements such as relevant provisions 
in the Federal Information Security 
Management Act, National Institute of 
Standards and Technology publica-
tions, and Office of Management and 
Budget guidance. 

(iii) The Relocation Payment Clear-
inghouse must hire a third-party firm 
to independently audit and verify, on 
an annual basis, the Relocation Pay-
ment Clearinghouse’s compliance with 
privacy and information security re-
quirements and to provide rec-
ommendations based on any audit find-
ings; to correct any negative audit 
findings and adopt any additional prac-
tices suggested by the auditor; and to 
report the results to the Bureau. 

(c) Reports and information. (1) The 
Relocation Payment Clearinghouse 
must provide quarterly reports that de-
tail the status of reimbursement funds 
available for clearing obligations, the 
relocation and accelerated relocation 
payments issued, the amounts col-
lected from overlay licensees, and any 
certifications filed by incumbents. The 
reports must account for all funds 
spent to transition the 3.7 GHz Service 
Band, including the Relocation Pay-
ment Clearinghouse’s own expenses, 

e.g., salaries and fees paid to law firms, 
accounting firms, and other consult-
ants. The report shall include descrip-
tions of any disputes and the manner 
in which they were resolved. 

(2) The Relocation Payment Clear-
inghouse shall provide to the Office of 
the Managing Director and the Wire-
less Telecommunications Bureau, by 
March 1 of each year, an audited state-
ment of funds expended to date, includ-
ing salaries and expenses of the Clear-
inghouse. 

(3) The Relocation Clearing House 
shall provide to the Wireless Tele-
communications Bureau additional in-
formation upon request. 

§ 27.1415 Documentation of expenses. 
Parties seeking reimbursement of 

compensable relocation costs must 
document their actual expenses and 
the Relocation Payment Clearing-
house, or a third-party on behalf of the 
Relocation Payment Clearinghouse, 
may conduct audits of entities that re-
ceive reimbursements. Entities receiv-
ing reimbursements must make avail-
able all relevant documentation upon 
request from the Relocation Payment 
Clearinghouse or its contractor. 

§ 27.1416 Reimbursable costs. 
(a) Determining reimbursable costs. The 

Relocation Payment Clearinghouse 
shall review reimbursement requests to 
determine whether they are reasonable 
and to ensure they comply with the re-
quirements adopted in this sub-part. 
The Relocation Payment Clearing-
house shall give parties the oppor-
tunity to supplement any reimburse-
ment claims that the Relocation Pay-
ment Clearinghouse deems deficient. 
Reimbursement submissions that fall 
within the estimated range of costs in 
the cost category schedule issued by 
the Wireless Telecommunications Bu-
reau shall be presumed reasonable. If 
the Relocation Payment Clearinghouse 
determines that the amount sought for 
reimbursement is unreasonable, it 
shall notify the party of the amount it 
deems eligible for reimbursement. The 
Wireless Telecommunications Bureau 
shall make further determinations re-
lated to reimbursable costs, as nec-
essary, throughout the transition proc-
ess. 
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