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47 CFR Ch. I (10–1–16 Edition) § 69.121 

§ 69.121 Connection charges for ex-
panded interconnection. 

(a) Appropriate connection charge 
subelements shall be established for 
the use of equipment and facilities that 
are associated with offerings of ex-
panded interconnection for special ac-
cess and switched transport services, as 
defined in part 64, subpart N of this 
chapter. To the extent that the same 
equipment and facilities are used to 
provide expanded interconnection for 
both special access and switched trans-
port, the same connection charge sub-
elements shall be used. 

(1) A cross-connect subelement shall 
be established for charges associated 
with the cross-connect cable and asso-
ciated facilities connecting the equip-
ment owned by or dedicated to the use 
of the interconnector with the tele-
phone company’s equipment and facili-
ties used to provide interstate special 
or switched access services. Charges for 
the cross-connect subelement shall not 
be deaveraged within a study area that 
is used for purposes of jurisdictional 
separations. 

(2) Charges for subelements associ-
ated with physical collocation or vir-
tual collocation, other than the subele-
ment described in paragraph (a)(1) of 
this section and subelements recov-
ering the cost of the virtual collocation 
equipment described in § 64.1401(e)(1) of 
this chapter, may reasonably differ in 
different central offices, notwith-
standing § 69.3(e)(7). 

(b) Connection charge subelements 
shall be computed based upon the costs 
associated with the equipment and fa-
cilities that are included in such sub-
elements, including no more than a 
just and reasonable portion of the tele-
phone company’s overhead costs. 

(c) Connection charge subelements 
shall be assessed upon all interconnec-
tors that use the equipment or facili-
ties that are included in such subele-
ments. 

[57 FR 54332, Nov. 18, 1992, as amended at 58 
FR 48764, Sept. 17, 1993; 59 FR 38930, Aug. 1, 
1994] 

§ 69.123 Density pricing zones for spe-
cial access and switched transport. 

(a)(1) Incumbent local exchange car-
riers not subject to price cap regula-
tion may establish any number of den-

sity zones within a study area that is 
used for purposes of jurisdictional sepa-
rations, provided that each zone, ex-
cept the highest-cost zone, accounts for 
at least 15 percent of that carrier’s spe-
cial access and transport revenues 
within that study area, calculated pur-
suant to the methodology set forth in 
§ 69.725. 

(2) Such a system of pricing zones 
shall be designed to reasonably reflect 
cost-related characteristics, such as 
the density of total interstate traffic in 
central offices located in the respective 
zones. 

(3) Non-price cap incumbent local ex-
change carriers may establish only one 
set of density pricing zones within each 
study area, to be used for the pricing of 
both special and switched access pursu-
ant to paragraphs (c) and (d) of this 
section. 

(b)(1) Incumbent local exchange car-
riers subject to price cap regulation 
may establish any number of density 
zones within a study area that is used 
for purposes of jurisdictional separa-
tions, provided that each zone, except 
the highest-cost zone, accounts for at 
least 15 percent of that carrier’s 
trunking basket revenues within that 
study area, calculated pursuant to the 
methodology set forth in § 69.725. 

(2) Price cap incumbent local ex-
change carriers may establish only one 
set of density pricing zones within each 
study area, to be used for the pricing of 
all services within the trunking basket 
for which zone density pricing is per-
mitted. 

(3) An access service subelement for 
which zone density pricing is permitted 
shall be deemed to be offered in the 
zone that contains the telephone com-
pany location from which the service is 
provided. 

(4) An access service subelement for 
which zone density pricing is permitted 
which is provided to a customer be-
tween telephone company locations 
shall be deemed to be offered in the 
highest priced zone that contains one 
of the locations between which the 
service is offered. 

(c) Notwithstanding § 69.3(e)(7), in 
study areas in which a telephone com-
pany offers a cross-connect, as de-
scribed in § 69.121(a)(1), for the trans-
mission of interstate special access 
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