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47 CFR Ch. I (10–1–16 Edition) § 65.800 

§ 69.108, Local Switching, § 69.107, 
Transport, §§ 69.110–69.112, 69.124, 69.125, 
and Information, § 69.109. The Billing 
and Collection access element shall not 
be included in any access service cat-
egory for purposes of this part. The 
Commission will also separately review 
exchange carrier overall interstate 
earnings subject to this part for deter-
mining compliance with the maximum 
allowable rate of return determined by 
§ 65.700(b). 

(b) For exchange carriers, earnings 
shall be measured for purposes of deter-
mining compliance with the maximum 
allowable rates of return separately for 
each study area; provided, however, 
that if the carrier has filed or con-
curred in access tariffs aggregating 
costs and rates for two or more study 
areas, the earnings will be determined 
for the aggregated study areas rather 
than for each study area separately. If 
an exchange carrier has not utilized 
the same level of study area aggrega-
tion during the entire two-year earn-
ings review period, then the carrier’s 
earnings will be measured for the en-
tire two-year period on the basis of the 
tariffs in effect at the end of the second 
year of the two-year review period; pro-
vided, however, that if tariffs rep-
resenting a higher level of study area 
aggregation were not in effect for at 
least eight months in the second year, 
then the carrier’s earnings will be 
measured on the basis of the study area 
level of aggregation in effect for the 
majority of the two-year period; pro-
vided further, that any carrier that was 
not a member of the National Ex-
change Carrier Association or other 
voluntary pools for both years of the 
two-year review period will have its 
earnings reviewed individually for the 
full two-year period. 

[51 FR 11034, Apr. 1, 1986, as amended at 57 
FR 54719, Nov. 20, 1992; 58 FR 48763, Sept. 17, 
1993; 60 FR 28546, June 1, 1995] 

Subpart G—Rate Base 

SOURCE: 53 FR 1029, Jan. 15, 1988, unless 
otherwise noted. 

§ 65.800 Rate base. 
The rate base shall consist of the 

interstate portion of the accounts list-
ed in § 65.820 that has been invested in 

plant used and useful in the efficient 
provision of interstate telecommuni-
cations services regulated by this Com-
mission, minus any deducted items 
computed in accordance with § 65.830. 

§ 65.810 Definitions. 

As used in this subpart ‘‘account 
xxxx’’ means the account of that num-
ber kept in accordance with the Uni-
form System of Accounts for Class A 
and Class B Telecommunications Com-
panies in 47 CFR part 32. 

§ 65.820 Included items. 

(a) Telecommunications plant. The 
interstate portion of all assets summa-
rized in Account 2001 (Telecommuni-
cations Plant in Service) and Account 
2002 (Property Held for Future Use), 
net of accumulated depreciation and 
amortization, and Account 2003 (Tele-
communications Plant Under Con-
struction), and, to the extent such in-
clusions are allowed by this Commis-
sion, Account 2005 (Telecommuni-
cations Plant Adjustment). Any inter-
est cost for funds used during construc-
tion capitalized on assets recorded in 
these accounts shall be computed in ac-
cordance with the procedures in Sec. 
32.2000(c)(2)(x) of this chapter. 

(b) Material and supplies. The inter-
state portion of assets summarized in 
Account 1220.1 (Material and Supplies). 

(c) Noncurrent assets. The interstate 
portion of Class B Rural Telephone 
Bank stock contained in Account 1410 
and the interstate portion of assets 
summarized in Account 1410 (Other 
Noncurrent Assets) and Account 1438 
(Deferred Maintenance, Retirements 
and Deferred Charges), only to the ex-
tent that they have been specifically 
approved by this Commission for inclu-
sion (Note: The interstate portion of 
assets summarized in Account 1410 
should not include any amounts re-
lated to investments, sinking funds or 
unamortized debt issuance expense). 
Except as noted above, no amounts 
from accounts 1406 through 1500 shall 
be included. 

(d) Cash working capital. The average 
amount of investor-supplied capital 
needed to provide funds for a carrier’s 
day-to-day interstate operations. Class 
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