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Federal Communications Commission § 54.902 

(d) In calculating support pursuant 
to paragraph (a) of this section for pe-
riods prior to when the tariff charge 
described in § 69.132 of this chapter be-
comes effective, only Interstate Com-
mon Line Revenue Requirement and 
Interstate Common line revenues shall 
be included. 

(e) To the extent necessary for rate-
making purposes, each carrier’s CAF 
BLS shall be attributed as follows: 

(1) First, support shall be applied to 
ensure that the carrier has met its 
Interstate Common Line Revenue Re-
quirement for the prior period to which 
true-up payments are currently being 
applied. 

(2) Second, support shall be applied 
to ensure that the carrier has met its 
Consumer Broadband-only Loop Rev-
enue Requirement for the prior period 
to which true-up payments are cur-
rently being applied. 

(3) Third, support shall be applied to 
ensure that the carrier will meet, on a 
forecasted basis, its Interstate Com-
mon Line Revenue Requirement during 
the current tariff year. 

(4) Finally, support shall be applied 
as available to the Consumer 
Broadband-only Loop Revenue Require-
ment during the current tariff year. 

(f) CAF BLS Support is subject to a 
reduction as necessary to meet the 
overall cap on support established by 
the Commission for support provided 
pursuant to this subpart and subpart M 
of this part. Reductions shall be imple-
mented as follows: 

(1) On May 1 of each year, the Admin-
istrator will publish a target amount 
for CAF BLS in the aggregate and the 
amount of CAF BLS that each study 
area will receive during the upcoming 
July 1 to June 30 tariff year. The target 
amount shall be the forecasted dis-
bursement amount times a reduction 
factor. The reduction factor shall be 
the budget amount divided by the total 
forecasted disbursement amount for 
both High Cost Loop Support and CAF 
BLS for recipients in the aggregate. 
The forecasted disbursement for CAF 
BLS is the forecasted total disburse-
ments for all recipients of CAF BLS, 
including both projections and true-ups 
in the upcoming July 1 to June 30 tariff 
year. 

(2) The Administrator shall apply a 
per-line reduction to each carrier’s 
CAF BLS equal to one-half the dif-
ference between the forecasted dis-
bursement amount and the target 
amount divided by the total number of 
loops eligible for support. To the ex-
tent that per-line reduction is greater 
than the amount of CAF BLS per loop 
for a given carrier, that excess amount 
shall be subject to reduction through 
the method described in paragraph 
(f)(3) of this section. 

(3) The Administrator shall apply an 
additional pro rata reduction to CAF 
BLS for each recipient of CAF BLS as 
necessary to achieve the target 
amount. 

(g) For purposes of this subpart and 
consistent with § 69.132 of this chapter, 
a consumer broadband-only loop is a 
line provided by a rate-of-return in-
cumbent local exchange carrier to a 
customer without regulated local ex-
change voice service, for use in connec-
tion with fixed Broadband Internet ac-
cess service, as defined in § 8.2 of this 
chapter. 

[81 FR 24342, Apr. 25, 2016] 

§ 54.902 Calculation of CAF BLS Sup-
port for transferred exchanges. 

(a) In the event that a rate-of-return 
carrier acquires exchanges from an en-
tity that is also a rate-of-return car-
rier, CAF BLS for the transferred ex-
changes shall be distributed as follows: 

(1) Each carrier may report its up-
dated line counts to reflect the transfer 
in the next quarterly line count filing 
pursuant to § 54.903(a)(1) that applies to 
the period in which the transfer oc-
curred. During a transition period from 
the filing of the updated line counts 
until the end of the funding year, the 
Administrator shall adjust the CAF 
BLS Support received by each carrier 
based on the updated line counts and 
the per-line CAF BLS, categorized by 
customer class and, if applicable, 
disaggregation zone, of the selling car-
rier. If the acquiring carrier does not 
file a quarterly update of its line 
counts, it will not receive CAF BLS for 
those lines during the transition pe-
riod. 
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(2) Each carrier’s projected data for 
the following funding year filed pursu-
ant to § 54.903(a)(3) shall reflect the 
transfer of exchanges. 

(3) Each carrier’s actual data filed 
pursuant to § 54.903(a)(4) shall reflect 
the transfer of exchanges. All post- 
transaction CAF BLS shall be subject 
to true up by the Administrator pursu-
ant to § 54.903(b)(3). 

(b) In the event that a rate-of-return 
carrier acquires exchanges from a 
price-cap carrier, absent further action 
by the Commission, the exchanges 
shall receive the same amount of sup-
port and be subject to the same public 
interest obligations as specified in 
§ 54.310 or § 54.312, as applicable. 

(c) In the event that an entity other 
than a rate-of-return carrier acquires 
exchanges from a rate-of-return car-
rier, absent further action by the Com-
mission, the carrier will receive model- 
based support and be subject to public 
interest obligations as specified in 
§ 54.310. 

(d) This section does not alter any 
Commission rule governing the sale or 
transfer of exchanges, including the 
definition of ‘‘study area’’ in part 36 of 
this chapter. 

[81 FR 24343, Apr. 25, 2016] 

§ 54.903 Obligations of rate-of-return 
carriers and the Administrator. 

(a) To be eligible for CAF BLS, each 
rate-of-return carrier shall make the 
following filings with the Adminis-
trator. 

(1) Each rate-of-return carrier shall 
submit to the Administrator in accord-
ance with the schedule in § 54.1306 the 
number of lines it serves, within each 
rate-of-return carrier study area show-
ing residential and single-line business 
line counts, multi-line business line 
counts, and consumer broadband-only 
line counts separately. For purposes of 
this report, and for purposes of com-
puting support under this subpart, the 
residential and single-line business 
class lines reported include lines as-
sessed the residential and single-line 
business End User Common Line 
charge pursuant to § 69.104 of this chap-
ter, the multi-line business class lines 
reported include lines assessed the 
multi-line business End User Common 
Line charge pursuant to § 69.104 of this 

chapter, and consumer broadband-only 
lines reported include lines assessed 
the Consumer Broadband-only Loop 
rate charged pursuant to § 69.132 of this 
chapter or provided on a detariffed 
basis. For purposes of this report, and 
for purposes of computing support 
under this subpart, lines served using 
resale of the rate-of-return local ex-
change carrier’s service pursuant to 
section 251(c)(4) of the Communications 
Act of 1934, as amended, shall be con-
sidered lines served by the rate-of-re-
turn carrier only and must be reported 
accordingly. 

(2) A rate-of-return carrier may sub-
mit the information in paragraph (a) of 
this section in accordance with the 
schedule in § 54.1306, even if it is not re-
quired to do so. If a rate-of-return car-
rier makes a filing under this para-
graph, it shall separately indicate any 
lines that it has acquired from another 
carrier that it has not previously re-
ported pursuant to paragraph (a) of 
this section, identified by customer 
class and the carrier from which the 
lines were acquired. 

(3) Each rate-of-return carrier shall 
submit to the Administrator annually 
by March 31 projected data necessary 
to calculate the carrier’s prospective 
CAF BLS, including common line and 
consumer broadband-only loop cost and 
revenue data, for each of its study 
areas in the upcoming funding year. 
The funding year shall be July 1 of the 
current year through June 30 of the 
next year. The data shall be accom-
panied by a certification that the cost 
data is compliant with the Commis-
sion’s cost allocation rules and does 
not reflect duplicative assignment of 
costs to the consumer broadband-only 
loop and special access categories. 

(4) Each rate-of-return carrier shall 
submit to the Administrator on De-
cember 31 of each year the data nec-
essary to calculate a carrier’s Connect 
America Fund CAF BLS, including 
common line and consumer broadband- 
only loop cost and revenue data, for 
the prior calendar year. Such data 
shall be used by the Administrator to 
make adjustments to monthly per-line 
CAF BLS amounts to the extent of any 
differences between the carrier’s CAF 
BLS received based on projected com-
mon line cost and revenue data, and 
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