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§ 54.724 Time periods for Commission 
approval of Administrator deci-
sions. 

(a) The Wireline Competition Bureau 
shall, within ninety (90) days, take ac-
tion in response to a request for review 
of an Administrator decision that is 
properly before it. The Wireline Com-
petition Bureau may extend the time 
period for taking action on a request 
for review of an Administrator decision 
for a period of up to ninety days. The 
Commission may also at any time, ex-
tend the time period for taking action 
of a request for review of an Adminis-
trator decision pending before the 
Wireline Competition Bureau. 

(b) The Commission shall issue a 
written decision in response to a re-
quest for review of an Administrator 
decision that involves novel questions 
of fact, law, or policy within ninety (90) 
days. The Commission may extend the 
time period for taking action on the re-
quest for review of an Administrator 
decision. The Wireline Competition Bu-
reau also may extend action on a re-
quest for review of an Administrator 
decision for a period of up to ninety 
days. 

[67 FR 13228, Mar. 21, 2002] 

§ 54.725 Universal service disburse-
ments during pendency of a request 
for review and Administrator deci-
sion. 

(a) When a party has sought review of 
an Administrator decision under 
§ 54.719(a) through (c) in connection 
with the schools and libraries support 
mechanism or the rural health care 
support mechanism, the Administrator 
shall not reimburse a service provider 
for the provision of discounted services 
until a final decision has been issued 
either by the Administrator or by the 
Federal Communications Commission; 
provided, however, that the Adminis-
trator may disburse funds for any 
amount of support that is not the sub-
ject of an appeal. 

(b) When a party has sought review of 
an Administrator decision under 
§ 54.719(a) through (c) in connection 
with the high cost and low income sup-
port mechanisms, the Administrator 
shall not disburse support to a service 
provider until a final decision has been 
issued either by the Administrator or 

by the Federal Communications Com-
mission; provided, however, that the 
Administrator may disburse funds for 
any amount of support that is not the 
subject of an appeal. 

Subpart J—Remote Areas Fund 

SOURCE: 81 FR 44952, July 7, 2016, unless 
otherwise noted. 

§ 54.801 Use of competitive bidding for 
Remote Areas Fund. 

The Commission will use competitive 
bidding, as provided in part 1, subpart 
AA of this chapter, to determine the 
recipients of Remote Areas Fund sup-
port and the amount of support that 
they may receive for specific geo-
graphic areas, subject to applicable 
post-auction procedures. 

§ 54.802 Geographic areas eligible for 
Remote Areas Fund support. 

Remote Areas Fund support may be 
made available for census blocks iden-
tified as eligible by public notice. 

§ 54.803 Provider eligibility. 

(a) Any eligible telecommunications 
carrier is eligible to receive Remote 
Areas Fund support in eligible areas. 

(b) An entity may obtain eligible 
telecommunications carrier designa-
tion after public notice of winning bid-
ders in the Remote Areas Fund auc-
tion. 

(c) To the extent any entity seeks el-
igible telecommunications carrier des-
ignation prior to public notice of win-
ning bidders for Remote Areas Fund 
support, its designation as an eligible 
telecommunications carrier may be 
conditional subject to the receipt of 
Remote Areas Fund support. 

§ 54.804 Application process. 

(a) Any entity qualified to bid in the 
Phase II auction pursuant to § 54.315(a) 
shall be pre-qualified to bid in the Re-
mote Areas Fund auction, subject to 
the requirement that there be no mate-
rial change in any information pre-
viously submitted in the application to 
bid for Phase II support. 

(b) In addition to providing informa-
tion specified in § 1.21001(b) of this 
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chapter and any other information re-
quired by the Commission, any appli-
cant to participate in competitive bid-
ding for Remote Areas Fund support 
shall: 

(1) Provide ownership information as 
set forth in § 1.2112(a) of this chapter; 

(2) Certify that the applicant is fi-
nancially and technically qualified to 
meet the public interest obligations es-
tablished for Remote Areas Fund sup-
port; 

(3) Disclose its status as an eligible 
telecommunications carrier to the ex-
tent applicable and certify that it ac-
knowledges that it must be designated 
as an eligible telecommunications car-
rier for the area in which it will receive 
support prior to being authorized to re-
ceive support; 

(4) Describe the technology or tech-
nologies that will be used to provide 
service for each bid; 

(5) Submit any information required 
to establish eligibility for any bidding 
weights adopted by the Commission in 
an order or public notice; 

(6) To the extent that an applicant 
plans to use spectrum to offer its voice 
and broadband services, demonstrate it 
has the proper authorizations, if appli-
cable, and access to operate on the 
spectrum it intends to use, and that 
the spectrum resources will be suffi-
cient to cover peak network usage and 
deliver the minimum performance re-
quirements to serve all of the fixed lo-
cations in eligible areas, and certify 
that it will retain its access to the 
spectrum for the term of support; and 

(7) Submit specified operational and 
financial information. 

(i) Submit a certification that the 
applicant has provided a voice, 
broadband, and/or electric transmission 
or distribution service for at least two 
years or that it is a wholly-owned sub-
sidiary of such an entity, and speci-
fying the number of years the appli-
cant or its parent company has been 
operating, and submit the financial 
statements from the prior fiscal year 
that are audited by a certified public 
accountant. If the applicant is not au-
dited in the ordinary course of busi-
ness, in lieu of submitting audited fi-
nancial statements it must certify that 
it will provide financial statements 
from the prior fiscal year that are au-

dited by a certified independent public 
accountant by a specified deadline dur-
ing the long-form application review 
process. 

(A) If the applicant has provided a 
voice and/or broadband service it must 
certify that it has filed FCC Form 477s 
as required during this time period. 

(B) If the applicant has operated only 
an electric transmission or distribution 
service, it must submit qualified oper-
ating or financial reports that it has 
filed with the relevant financial insti-
tution for the relevant time period 
along with a certification that the sub-
mission is a true and accurate copy of 
the reports that were provided to the 
relevant financial institution. 

(ii) If an applicant cannot meet the 
requirements in paragraph (b)(7)(i) of 
this section, in the alternative it must 
submit the audited financial state-
ments from the three most recent fis-
cal years and a letter of interest from 
a bank meeting the qualifications set 
forth in paragraph (d)(2) of this section, 
that the bank would provide a letter of 
credit as described in paragraph (d) of 
this section to the bidder if the bidder 
were selected for bids of a certain dol-
lar magnitude. 

(c) Application by winning bidders for 
Remote Areas Fund support—(1) Dead-
line. As provided by public notice, win-
ning bidders for Remote Areas Fund 
support shall file an application for Re-
mote Areas Fund support no later than 
the number of business days specified 
after the public notice identifying 
them as winning bidders. 

(2) Application contents. An applica-
tion for Remote Areas Fund support 
must contain: 

(i) Identification of the party seeking 
the support, including ownership infor-
mation as set forth in § 1.2112(a) of this 
chapter; 

(ii) Certification that the applicant is 
financially and technically qualified to 
meet the public interest obligations for 
Remote Areas Fund support in each 
area for which it seeks support; 

(iii) Certification that the applicant 
will meet the relevant public interest 
obligations, including the requirement 
that it will offer service at rates that 
are equal or lower to the Commission’s 
reasonable comparability benchmarks 
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for fixed wireline services offered in 
urban areas; 

(iv) A description of the technology 
and system design the applicant in-
tends to use to deliver voice and 
broadband service, including a network 
diagram which must be certified by a 
professional engineer. The professional 
engineer must certify that the network 
is capable of delivering, to at least 95 
percent of the required number of loca-
tions in each relevant state, voice and 
broadband service that meets the req-
uisite performance requirements for 
Remote Areas Fund support; 

(v) Certification that the applicant 
will have available funds for all project 
costs that exceed the amount of sup-
port to be received from the Remote 
Areas Fund for the first two years of 
its support term and that the applicant 
will comply with all program require-
ments, including service milestones; 

(vi) A description of how the required 
construction will be funded, including 
financial projections that demonstrate 
the applicant can cover the necessary 
debt service payments over the life of 
the loan, if any; 

(vii) Certification that the party sub-
mitting the application is authorized 
to do so on behalf of the applicant; and 

(viii) Such additional information as 
the Commission may require. 

(3) No later than the number of days 
provided by public notice, the appli-
cant shall submit a letter from a bank 
meeting the eligibility requirements 
outlined in paragraph (d) of this sec-
tion committing to issue an irrev-
ocable stand-by letter of credit, in the 
required form, to the winning bidder. 
The letter shall at a minimum provide 
the dollar amount of the letter of cred-
it and the issuing bank’s agreement to 
follow the terms and conditions of the 
Commission’s model letter of credit. 

(4) No later than 180 days after the 
public notice identifying them as a 
winning bidder, bidders that did not 
submit audited financial statements in 
their short-form application pursuant 
to paragraph (b)(7)(i) of this section 
must submit the financial statements 
from the prior fiscal year that are au-
dited by a certified independent public 
accountant. 

(5) No later than 180 days after the 
public notice identifying it as a win-

ning bidder, the applicant shall certify 
that it is an eligible telecommuni-
cations carrier in any area for which it 
seeks support and submit the relevant 
documentation supporting that certifi-
cation. 

(6) Application processing. (i) No appli-
cation will be considered unless it has 
been submitted in an acceptable form 
during the period specified by public 
notice. No applications submitted or 
demonstrations made at any other 
time shall be accepted or considered. 

(ii) Any application that, as of the 
submission deadline, either does not 
identify the applicant seeking support 
as specified in the public notice an-
nouncing application procedures or 
does not include required certifications 
shall be denied. 

(iii) An applicant may be afforded an 
opportunity to make minor modifica-
tions to amend its application or cor-
rect defects noted by the applicant, the 
Commission, the Administrator, or 
other parties. Minor modifications in-
clude correcting typographical errors 
in the application and supplying non- 
material information that was inad-
vertently omitted or was not available 
at the time the application was sub-
mitted. 

(iv) Applications to which major 
modifications are made after the dead-
line for submitting applications shall 
be denied. Major modifications include, 
but are not limited to, any changes in 
the ownership of the applicant that 
constitute an assignment or change of 
control, or the identity of the appli-
cant, or the certifications required in 
the application. 

(v) After receipt and review of the ap-
plications, a public notice shall iden-
tify each winning bidder that may be 
authorized to receive Remote Areas 
Fund support after the winning bidder 
submits a letter of credit and an ac-
companying opinion letter as described 
in paragraph (d) of this section, in a 
form acceptable to the Commission. 
Each such winning bidder shall submit 
a letter of credit and accompanying 
opinion letter as required by paragraph 
(d) of this section, in a form acceptable 
to the Commission no later than the 
number of business days provided by 
public notice. 
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(vi) After receipt of all necessary in-
formation, a public notice will identify 
each winning bidder that is authorized 
to receive Remote Areas Fund support. 

(d) Letter of credit. Before being au-
thorized to receive Remote Areas Fund 
support, a winning bidder shall obtain 
an irrevocable standby letter of credit 
which shall be acceptable in all re-
spects to the Commission. 

(1) Value. Each recipient authorized 
to receive Remote Areas Fund support 
shall maintain the standby letter of 
credit or multiple standby letters of 
credit in an amount equal to at a min-
imum the amount of Remote Areas 
Fund support that has been disbursed 
and that will be disbursed in the com-
ing year, until the Universal Service 
Administrative Company has verified 
that the recipient met the final service 
milestone as described in § 54.310(c). 

(i) Once the recipient has met its 60 
percent service milestone, it may ob-
tain a new letter of credit or renew its 
existing letter of credit so that it is 
valued at a minimum at 90 percent of 
the total support amount already dis-
bursed plus the amount that will be 
disbursed in the coming year. 

(ii) Once the recipient has met its 80 
percent service milestone, it may ob-
tain a new letter of credit or renew its 
existing letter of credit so that it is 
valued at a minimum at 80 percent of 
the total support that has been dis-
bursed plus the amount that will be 
disbursed in the coming year. 

(2) The bank issuing the letter of 
credit shall be acceptable to the Com-
mission. A bank that is acceptable to 
the Commission is: 

(i) Any United States bank 
(A) That is insured by the Federal 

Deposit Insurance Corporation, and 
(B) That has a bank safety rating 

issued by Weiss of B- or better; or 
(ii) CoBank, so long as it maintains 

assets that place it among the 100 larg-
est United States Banks, determined 
on basis of total assets as of the cal-
endar year immediately preceding the 
issuance of the letter of credit and it 
has a long-term unsecured credit rat-
ing issued by Standard & Poor’s of 
BBB- or better (or an equivalent rating 
from another nationally recognized 
credit rating agency); or 

(iii) The National Rural Utilities Co-
operative Finance Corporation, so long 
as it maintains assets that place it 
among the 100 largest United States 
Banks, determined on basis of total as-
sets as of the calendar year imme-
diately preceding the issuance of the 
letter of credit and it has a long-term 
unsecured credit rating issued by 
Standard & Poor’s of BBB- or better (or 
an equivalent rating from another na-
tionally recognized credit rating agen-
cy); or 

(iv) Any non-United States bank: 
(A) That is among the 50 largest non- 

U.S. banks in the world, determined on 
the basis of total assets as of the end of 
the calendar year immediately pre-
ceding the issuance of the letter of 
credit (determined on a U.S. dollar 
equivalent basis as of such date); 

(B) Has a branch office in the District 
of Columbia or such other branch office 
agreed to by the Commission; 

(C) Has a long-term unsecured credit 
rating issued by a widely-recognized 
credit rating agency that is equivalent 
to a BBB- or better rating by Standard 
& Poor’s; and 

(D) Issues the letter of credit payable 
in United States dollars 

(3) A winning bidder for Remote 
Areas Fund support shall provide with 
its letter of credit an opinion letter 
from its legal counsel clearly stating, 
subject only to customary assump-
tions, limitations, and qualifications, 
that in a proceeding under Title 11 of 
the United States Code, 11 U.S.C. 101 et 
seq. (the ‘‘Bankruptcy Code’’), the 
bankruptcy court would not treat the 
letter of credit or proceeds of the letter 
of credit as property of the winning 
bidder’s bankruptcy estate under sec-
tion 541 of the Bankruptcy Code. 

(4) Authorization to receive Remote 
Areas Fund support is conditioned 
upon full and timely performance of all 
of the requirements set forth in this 
section, and any additional terms and 
conditions upon which the support was 
granted. 

(i) Failure by a Remote Areas Fund 
support recipient to meet its service 
milestones as required by § 54.310 will 
trigger reporting obligations and the 
withholding of support as described in 
§ 54.320(c). Failure to come into full 
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compliance within 12 months will trig-
ger a recovery action by the Universal 
Service Administrative Company. If 
the Remote Areas Fund recipient does 
not repay the requisite amount of sup-
port within six months, the Universal 
Service Administrative Company will 
be entitled to draw the entire amount 
of the letter of credit and may dis-
qualify the Remote Areas Fund support 
recipient from the receipt of Remote 
Areas Fund support or additional uni-
versal service support. 

(ii) The default will be evidenced by a 
letter issued by the Chief of the 
Wireline Competition Bureau or the 
Wireless Telecommunications Bureau, 
or their respective designees, which 
letter, attached to a standby letter of 
credit draw certificate, shall be suffi-
cient for a draw on the standby letter 
of credit for the entire amount of the 
standby letter of credit. 

EFFECTIVE DATE NOTE: At 81 FR 44452, July 
7, 2016, § 54.804 was added. However, para-
graphs (b) through (d) contain information 
collection and recordkeeping requirements 
and will not become effective until approval 
has been given by the Office of Management 
and Budget. 

§ 54.805 [Reserved] 

§ 54.806 Remote Areas Fund reporting 
obligations. 

Recipients of Remote Areas Fund 
support shall be subject to the report-
ing obligations set forth in § 54.313. 

EFFECTIVE DATE NOTE: At 81 FR 44452, July 
7, 2016, § 54.806 was added. However, this sec-
tion contains information collection and rec-
ordkeeping requirements and will not be-
come effective until approval has been given 
by the Office of Management and Budget. 

Subpart K—Interstate Common 
Line Support Mechanism for 
Rate-of-Return Carriers 

SOURCE: 66 FR 59728, Nov. 30, 2001, unless 
otherwise noted. 

§ 54.901 Calculation of Connect Amer-
ica Fund Broadband Loop Support. 

(a) Connect America Fund Broadband 
Loop Support (CAF BLS) available to a 
rate-of-return carrier shall equal the 
Interstate Common Line Revenue Re-
quirement per Study Area, plus the 

Consumer Broadband-Only Revenue 
Requirement per Study Area as cal-
culated in accordance with part 69 of 
this chapter, minus: 

(1) The study area revenues obtained 
from end user common line charges at 
their allowable maximum as deter-
mined by § 69.104(n) and (o) of this chap-
ter; 

(2) Imputed Consumer Broadband- 
only Revenues, to be calculated as: 

(i) The lesser of $42 * the number of 
consumer broadband-only loops * 12 or 
the Consumer Broadband-Only Revenue 
Requirement per Study Area; or 

(ii) For the purpose of calculating the 
reconciliation pursuant to § 54.903(b)(3), 
the greater of the amount determined 
pursuant to paragraph (a)(2)(i) of this 
section or the carrier’s allowable Con-
sumer Broadband-only rate calculated 
pursuant to § 69.132 of this chapter * the 
number of consumer broadband-only 
loops * 12; 

(3) The special access surcharge pur-
suant to § 69.115 of this chapter; and 

(4) The line port costs in excess of 
basic analog service pursuant to § 69.130 
of this chapter. 

(b) For the purpose of calculating 
support pursuant to paragraph (a) of 
this section, the Interstate Common 
Line Revenue Requirement and Con-
sumer Broadband-only Revenue Re-
quirement shall be subject to the lim-
its on operating expenses and capital 
investment allowances pursuant to 
§ 54.303. 

(c) For purposes of calculating the 
amount of CAF BLS, determined pur-
suant to paragraph (a) of this section, 
that a non-price cap carrier may re-
ceive, the corporate operations expense 
allocated to the Common Line Revenue 
Requirement or the Consumer 
Broadband-only Loop Revenue Require-
ment, pursuant to § 69.409 of this chap-
ter, shall be limited to the lesser of: 

(1) The actual average monthly per- 
loop corporate operations expense; or 

(2) The portion of the monthly per- 
loop amount computed pursuant to 
§ 54.1308(a)(4)(iii) that would be allo-
cated to the Interstate Common Line 
Revenue Requirement or Consumer 
Broadband-only Loop Revenue Require-
ment pursuant to § 69.409 of this chap-
ter. 
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