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the schools and libraries discount ma-
trix in § 54.505(c). Schools and libraries 
eligible for a 90 percent discount shall 
receive first priority for the category 
one funds. The Administrator shall 
next allocate funds toward the requests 
submitted by schools and libraries eli-
gible for an 80 percent discount, then 
for a 70 percent discount, and shall con-
tinue committing funds for category 
one services in the same manner to the 
applicants at each descending discount 
level until there are no funds remain-
ing. 

(2) Category two. The Administrator 
shall next calculate the demand for 
category two services for all discount 
categories as determined by the 
schools and libraries discount matrix 
in § 54.505(c). If that demand exceeds 
the category two budget for that fund-
ing year, the Administrator shall allo-
cate the category two funds beginning 
with the most economically disadvan-
taged schools and libraries, as deter-
mined by the schools and libraries dis-
count matrix in § 54.505(c). The Admin-
istrator shall allocate funds toward the 
category two requests submitted by 
schools and libraries eligible for an 85 
percent discount first, then for a 80 
percent discount, and shall continue 
committing funds in the same manner 
to the applicants at each descending 
discount level until there are no cat-
egory two funds remaining. 

(3) To the extent that there are sin-
gle discount percentage levels associ-
ated with ‘‘shared services’’ under 
§ 54.505(b)(4), the Administrator shall 
allocate funds to the applicants at each 
descending discount level (e.g., 90 per-
cent, 89 percent, then 88 percent) until 
there are no funds remaining. 

(4) For both paragraphs (f)(1) and (2) 
of this section, if the remaining funds 
are not sufficient to support all of the 
funding requests within a particular 
discount level, the Administrator shall 
allocate funds at that discount level 
using the percentage of students eligi-
ble for the National School Lunch Pro-
gram. Thus, if there is not enough sup-
port to fund all requests at the 40 per-
cent discount level, the Administrator 
shall allocate funds beginning with 
those applicants with the highest per-
centage of NSLP eligibility for that 
discount level by funding those appli-

cants with 19 percent NSLP eligibility, 
then 18 percent NSLP eligibility, and 
shall continue committing funds in the 
same manner to applicants at each de-
scending percentage of NSLP until 
there are no funds remaining. 

[79 FR 49201, Aug. 19, 2014, as amended at 80 
FR 5990, Feb. 4, 2015] 

§§ 54.508–54.509 [Reserved] 

§ 54.511 Ordering services. 
(a) Selecting a provider of eligible serv-

ices. Except as exempted in § 54.503(e), 
in selecting a provider of eligible serv-
ices, schools, libraries, library con-
sortia, and consortia including any of 
those entities shall carefully consider 
all bids submitted and must select the 
most cost-effective service offering. In 
determining which service offering is 
the most cost-effective, entities may 
consider relevant factors other than 
the pre-discount prices submitted by 
providers, but price should be the pri-
mary factor considered. 

(b) Lowest corresponding price. Pro-
viders of eligible services shall not sub-
mit bids for or charge schools, school 
districts, libraries, library consortia, 
or consortia including any of these en-
tities a price above the lowest cor-
responding price for supported services, 
unless the Commission, with respect to 
interstate services or the state com-
mission with respect to intrastate serv-
ices, finds that the lowest cor-
responding price is not compensatory. 
Promotional rates offered by a service 
provider for a period of more than 90 
days must be included among the com-
parable rates upon which the lowest 
corresponding price is determined. 

[79 FR 59203, Aug. 19, 2014] 

§ 54.513 Resale and transfer of serv-
ices. 

(a) Prohibition on resale. Eligible sup-
ported services provided at a discount 
under this subpart shall not be sold, re-
sold, or transferred in consideration of 
money or any other thing of value, ex-
cept as provided in paragraph (b) of 
this section. 

(b) Disposal of obsolete equipment com-
ponents of eligible services. Eligible 
equipment components of eligible serv-
ices purchased at a discount under this 
subpart shall be considered obsolete if 
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