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Federal Communications Commission § 76.1507 

(3) Television broadcast stations are 
required to make the same election for 
open video systems and cable systems 
serving the same geographic area, un-
less the overlapping open video system 
is unable to deliver appropriate signals 
in conformance with the broadcast sta-
tion’s elections for all cable systems 
serving the same geographic area. 

(4) An open video system com-
mencing new operations shall notify all 
local commercial and noncommercial 
broadcast stations as required under 
paragraph (l) of this section on or be-
fore the date on which it files with the 
Commission its Notice of Intent to es-
tablish an open video system. 

(m) Exemption from input selector 
switch rules. Any provision of § 76.70 
that refers to a ‘‘cable system’’ or 
‘‘cable systems’’ shall apply to an open 
video system or open video systems. 

(n) Special relief and must-carry com-
plaint procedures. The procedures set 
forth in § 76.7 shall apply to special re-
lief and must-carry complaints relat-
ing to open video systems, and not the 
procedures set forth in § 76.1514 (Dis-
pute resolution). Any provision of § 76.7 
that refers to a ‘‘cable television sys-
tem operator’’ or ‘‘cable operator’’ 
shall apply to an open video system op-
erator. Any provision of § 76.7 that re-
fers to a ‘‘cable television system’’ 
shall apply to an open video system. 
Any provision of § 76.7 that refers to a 
‘‘system community unit’’ shall apply 
to an open video system or that por-
tion of an open video system that oper-
ates or will operate within a separate 
and distinct community or municipal 
entity (including unincorporated com-
munities within unincorporated areas 
and including single, discrete unincor-
porated areas). 

[61 FR 28708, June 5, 1996, as amended at 61 
FR 43177, Aug. 21, 1996; 79 FR 63562, Oct. 24, 
2014; 80 FR 5050, Jan. 30, 2015] 

§ 76.1507 Competitive access to sat-
ellite cable programming. 

(a) Any provision that applies to a 
cable operator under §§ 76.1000 through 
76.1003 shall also apply to an operator 
of an open video system and its affil-
iate which provides video programming 
on its open video system, except as 
limited by paragraph (a) (1)–(3) of this 
section. Any such provision that ap-

plies to a satellite cable programming 
vendor in which a cable operator has 
an attributable interest shall also 
apply to any satellite cable program-
ming vendor in which an open video 
system operator has an attributable in-
terest, except as limited by paragraph 
(a) (1)–(3) of this section. 

(1) Section 76.1002(c)(1) shall only re-
strict the conduct of an open video sys-
tem operator, its affiliate that provides 
video programming on its open video 
system and a satellite cable program-
ming vendor in which an open video 
system operator has an attributable in-
terest, as follows: No open video sys-
tem operator or its affiliate that pro-
vides video programming on its open 
video system shall engage in any prac-
tice or activity or enter into any un-
derstanding or arrangement, including 
exclusive contracts, with a satellite 
cable programming vendor or satellite 
broadcast programming vendor for sat-
ellite cable programming or satellite 
broadcast programming that prevents 
a multichannel video programming dis-
tributor from obtaining such program-
ming from any satellite cable program-
ming vendor in which an open video 
system operator has an attributable in-
terest, or any satellite broadcasting 
vendor in which an open video system 
operator has an attributable interest 
for distribution to person in areas not 
served by a cable operator as of Octo-
ber 5, 1992. 

(2) [Reserved] 
(3) Section 76.1002(c)(3)(i) and (ii) 

shall only restrict the conduct of an 
open video system operator, its affil-
iate that provides video programming 
on its open video system and a satellite 
cable programming vendor in which an 
open video system operator has an at-
tributable interest, as follows: No open 
video system operator shall enter into 
any subdistribution agreement or ar-
rangement for satellite cable program-
ming or satellite broadcast program-
ming with a satellite cable program-
ming vendor in which an open video 
system operator has an attributable in-
terest or a satellite broadcast program-
ming vendor in which an open video 
system operator has an attributable in-
terest for distribution to persons in 
areas not served by a cable operator as 
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of October 5, 1992 unless such agree-
ment or arrangement complies with 
the limitations set forth in 
§ 76.1002(c)(3)(ii). 

(b) No open video system program-
ming provider in which a cable oper-
ator has an attributable interest shall 
engage in any practice or activity or 
enter into any understanding or ar-
rangement, including exclusive con-
tracts, with a satellite cable program-
ming vendor or satellite broadcast pro-
gramming vendor for satellite cable 
programming or satellite broadcast 
programming that prevents a multi-
channel video programming distributor 
from obtaining such programming from 
any satellite cable programming ven-
dor in which a cable operator has an 
attributable interest, or any satellite 
broadcasting vendor in which a cable 
operator has an attributable interest 
for distribution to person in areas not 
served by a cable operator as of Octo-
ber 5, 1992. 

[61 FR 28708, June 5, 1996, as amended at 77 
FR 66048, Oct. 31, 2012] 

§ 76.1508 Network non-duplication. 
(a) Sections 76.92 through 76.97 shall 

apply to open video systems in accord-
ance with the provisions contained in 
this section. 

(b) Any provision of § 76.92 that refers 
to a ‘‘cable community unit’’ or ‘‘com-
munity unit’’ shall apply to an open 
video system or that portion of an open 
video system that operates or will op-
erate within a separate and distinct 
community or municipal entity (in-
cluding unincorporated communities 
within unincorporated areas and in-
cluding single, discrete unincorporated 
areas). Any provision of § 76.92 that re-
fers to a ‘‘cable television community’’ 
shall apply to an open video system 
community. Any provision of § 76.92 
that refers to a ‘‘cable television sys-
tem’s mandatory signal carriage obli-
gations’’ shall apply to an open video 
system’s mandatory signal carriage ob-
ligations. 

(c) Any provision of § 76.94 that refers 
to a ‘‘cable system operator’’ or ‘‘cable 
television system operator’’ shall apply 
to an open video system operator. Any 
provision of § 76.94 that refers to a 
‘‘cable system’’ or ‘‘cable television 
system’’ shall apply to an open video 

system except § 76.94 (e) and (f) which 
shall apply to an open video system op-
erator. Open video system operators 
shall make all notifications and infor-
mation regarding the exercise of net-
work non-duplication rights imme-
diately available to all appropriate 
video programming provider on the 
system. An open video system operator 
shall not be subject to sanctions for 
any violation of these rules by an unaf-
filiated program supplier if the oper-
ator provided proper notices to the pro-
gram supplier and subsequently took 
prompt steps to stop the distribution of 
the infringing program once it was no-
tified of a violation. 

(d) Any provision of § 76.95 that refers 
to a ‘‘cable system’’ or a ‘‘cable com-
munity unit’’ shall apply to an open 
video system or that portion of an open 
video system that operates or will op-
erate within a separate and distinct 
community or municipal entity (in-
cluding unincorporated communities 
within unincorporated areas and in-
cluding single, discrete unincorporated 
areas). 

§ 76.1509 Syndicated program exclu-
sivity. 

(a) Sections 76.151 through 76.163 
shall apply to open video systems in 
accordance with the provisions con-
tained in this section. 

(b) Any provision of § 76.151 that re-
fers to a ‘‘cable community unit’’ shall 
apply to an open video system. 

(c) Any provision of § 76.155 that re-
fers to a ‘‘cable system operator’’ or 
‘‘cable television system operator’’ 
shall apply to an open video system op-
erator. Any provision of § 76.155 that re-
fers to a ‘‘cable system’’ or ‘‘cable tele-
vision system’’ shall apply to an open 
video system except § 76.155(c) which 
shall apply to an open video system op-
erator. Open video system operators 
shall make all notifications and infor-
mation regarding exercise of syn-
dicated program exclusivity rights im-
mediately available to all appropriate 
video programming provider on the 
system. An open video system operator 
shall not be subject to sanctions for 
any violation of these rules by an unaf-
filiated program supplier if the oper-
ator provided proper notices to the pro-
gram supplier and subsequently took 
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