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as a result of the installation of an an-
tenna on an AM tower. In the event 
these processes are not completed be-
fore an antenna structure is con-
structed, any holder of or applicant for 
a Commission authorization is respon-
sible for completing these processes be-
fore locating or proposing to locate an 
antenna on the structure, as described 
in this subpart. 

§ 1.30001 Definitions. 

For purposes of this subpart: 
(a) Wavelength at the AM frequency. In 

this subpart, critical distances from an 
AM station are described in terms of 
the AM wavelength. The AM wave-
length, expressed in meters, is com-
puted as follows: 

(300 meters)/(AM frequency in mega-
hertz) = AM wavelength in meters. 

For example, at the AM frequency of 
1000 kHz, or 1 MHz, the wavelength is 
(300/1 MHz) = 300 meters. 

(b) Electrical degrees at the AM fre-
quency. This term describes the height 
of a proposed tower as a function of the 
frequency of a nearby AM station. To 
compute tower height in electrical de-
grees, first determine the AM wave-
length in meters as described in para-
graph (a) of this section. Tower height 
in electrical degrees is computed as fol-
lows: (Tower height in meters)/(AM 
wavelength in meters) × 360 degrees = 
Tower height in electrical degrees. For 
example, if the AM frequency is 1000 
kHz, then the wavelength is 300 meters, 
per paragraph (a) of this section. A 
nearby tower 75 meters tall is therefore 
[75/300] × 360 = 90 electrical degrees tall 
at the AM frequency. 

(c) Proponent. The term proponent re-
fers in this section to the party pro-
posing tower construction or signifi-
cant modification of an existing tower 
or proposing installation of an antenna 
on an AM tower. 

(d) Distance from the AM station. The 
distance shall be calculated from the 
tower coordinates in the case of a non-
directional AM station, or from the 
array center coordinates given in 
CDBS or any successor database for a 
directional AM station. 

§ 1.30002 Tower construction or modi-
fication near AM stations. 

(a) Proponents of construction or sig-
nificant modification of a tower which 
is within one wavelength of a nondirec-
tional AM station, and is taller than 60 
electrical degrees at the AM frequency, 
must notify the AM station at least 30 
days in advance of the commencement 
of construction. The proponent shall 
examine the potential impact of the 
construction or modification as de-
scribed in paragraph (c) of this section. 
If the construction or modification 
would distort the radiation pattern by 
more than 2 dB, the proponent shall be 
responsible for the installation and 
maintenance of any detuning appa-
ratus necessary to restore proper oper-
ation of the nondirectional antenna. 

(b) Proponents of construction or sig-
nificant modification of a tower which 
is within the lesser of 10 wavelengths 
or 3 kilometers of a directional AM sta-
tion, and is taller than 36 electrical de-
grees at the AM frequency, must notify 
the AM station at least 30 days in ad-
vance of the commencement of con-
struction. The proponent shall examine 
the potential impact of the construc-
tion or modification as described in 
paragraph (c) of this section. If the 
construction or modification would re-
sult in radiation in excess of the AM 
station’s licensed standard pattern or 
augmented standard pattern values, 
the proponent shall be responsible for 
the installation and maintenance of 
any detuning apparatus necessary to 
restore proper operation of the direc-
tional antenna. 

(c) Proponents of construction or sig-
nificant modification of a tower within 
the distances defined in paragraphs (a) 
and (b) of this section of an AM station 
shall examine the potential effects 
thereof using a moment method anal-
ysis. The moment method analysis 
shall consist of a model of the AM an-
tenna together with the potential re- 
radiating tower in a lossless environ-
ment. The model shall employ the 
methodology specified in § 73.151(c) of 
this chapter, except that the AM an-
tenna elements may be modeled as a 
series of thin wires driven to produce 
the required radiation pattern, without 
any requirement for measurement of 
tower impedances. 
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