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Federal Communications Commission § 1.267 

shall be served on all parties to the 
proceedings. 

[71 FR 15618, Mar. 29, 2006] 

§ 1.261 Corrections to transcript. 
At any time during the course of the 

proceeding, or as directed by the pre-
siding officer, but not later than 10 
days after the date of notice of certifi-
cation of the transcript, any party to 
the proceeding may file with the pre-
siding officer a motion requesting the 
correction of the transcript, which mo-
tion shall be accompanied by proof of 
service thereof upon all other parties 
to the proceeding. Within 5 days after 
the filing of such a motion, other par-
ties may file a pleading in support of or 
in opposition to such motion. There-
after, the presiding officer shall, by 
order, specify the corrections to be 
made in the transcript, and a copy of 
the order shall be served upon all par-
ties and made a part of the record. The 
presiding officer, on his own initiative, 
may specify corrections to be made in 
the transcript on 5 days’ notice. 

[40 FR 51441, Nov. 5, 1975] 

§ 1.263 Proposed findings and conclu-
sions. 

(a) Each party to the proceeding may 
file proposed findings of fact and con-
clusions, briefs, or memoranda of law: 
Provided, however, That the presiding 
officer may direct any party other than 
Commission counsel to file proposed 
findings of fact and conclusions, briefs, 
or memoranda of law. Such proposed 
findings of fact, conclusions, briefs, and 
memoranda of law shall be filed within 
20 days after the record is closed, un-
less additional time is allowed. 

(b) All pleadings and other papers 
filed pursuant to this section shall be 
accompanied by proof of service there-
of upon all other counsel in the pro-
ceeding; if a party is not represented 
by counsel, proof of service upon such 
party shall be made. 

(c) In the absence of a showing of 
good cause therefor, the failure to file 
proposed findings of fact, conclusions, 
briefs, or memoranda of law, when di-
rected to do so, may be deemed a waiv-
er of the right to participate further in 
the proceeding. 

(5 U.S.C. 557) 

§ 1.264 Contents of findings of fact and 
conclusions. 

Proposed findings of fact shall be set 
forth in serially numbered paragraphs 
and shall set out in detail and with 
particularity all basic evidentiary 
facts developed on the record (with ap-
propriate citations to the transcript of 
record or exhibit relied on for each evi-
dentiary fact) supporting the conclu-
sions proposed by the party filing 
same. Proposed conclusions shall be 
separately stated. Proposed findings of 
fact and conclusions submitted by a 
person other than an applicant may be 
limited to those issues in connection 
with the hearing which affect the in-
terests of such person. 

(5 U.S.C. 557) 

§ 1.267 Initial and recommended deci-
sions. 

(a) Except as provided in this para-
graph, in §§ 1.94, 1.251 and 1.274, or 
where the proceeding is terminated on 
motion (see § 1.302), the presiding offi-
cer shall prepare an initial (or rec-
ommended) decision, which shall be 
transmitted to the Secretary of the 
Commission. In the case of rate mak-
ing proceedings conducted under sec-
tions 201–205 of the Communications 
Act, the presumption shall be that the 
presiding officer shall prepare an ini-
tial or recommended decision. The Sec-
retary will make the decision public 
immediately and file it in the docket of 
the case. 

(b) Each initial and recommended de-
cision shall contain findings of fact and 
conclusions, as well as the reasons or 
basis therefor, upon all the material 
issues of fact, law, or discretion pre-
sented on the record; each initial deci-
sion shall also contain the appropriate 
rule or order, and the sanction, relief 
or denial thereof; and each rec-
ommended decision shall contain rec-
ommendations as to what disposition 
of the case should be made by the Com-
mission. Each initial decision will 
show the date upon which it will be-
come effective in accordance with the 
rules in this part in the absence of ex-
ceptions, appeal, or review. 

(c) The authority of the Presiding Of-
ficer over the proceedings shall cease 
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