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Federal Communications Commission § 64.1504 

other means to prevent unauthorized 
access to the service by nonsubscribers; 

(5) Provided, however, that disclosure 
of a credit, prepaid account, debit, 
charge, or calling card number, along 
with authorization to bill that number, 
made during the course of a call to an 
information service shall constitute a 
presubscription or comparable arrange-
ment if an introductory message con-
taining the information specified in 
§ 64.1504(c)(2) is provided prior to, and 
independent of, assessment of any 
charges. No other action taken by a 
consumer during the course of a call to 
an information service, for which 
charges are assessed, can create a 
presubscription or comparable arrange-
ment. 

(6) Provided, that a presubscription 
arrangement to obtain information 
services provided by means of a toll- 
free number shall conform to the re-
quirements of § 64.1504(c). 

(c) Calling card means an identifying 
number or code unique to the indi-
vidual, that is issued to the individual 
by a common carrier and enables the 
individual to be charged by means of a 
phone bill for charges incurred inde-
pendent of where the call originates. 

[61 FR 39087, July 26, 1996] 

§ 64.1502 Limitations on the provision 
of pay-per-call services. 

Any common carrier assigning a tele-
phone number to a provider of inter-
state pay-per-call service shall require, 
by contract or tariff, that such pro-
vider comply with the provisions of 
this subpart and of titles II and III of 
the Telephone Disclosure and Dispute 
Resolution Act (Pub. L. No. 102–556) 
(TDDRA) and the regulations pre-
scribed by the Federal Trade Commis-
sion pursuant to those titles. 

§ 64.1503 Termination of pay-per-call 
and other information programs. 

(a) Any common carrier assigning a 
telephone number to a provider of 
interstate pay-per-call service shall 
specify by contract or tariff that pay- 
per-call programs not in compliance 
with § 64.1502 shall be terminated fol-
lowing written notice to the informa-
tion provider. The information pro-
vider shall be afforded a period of no 
less than seven and no more than 14 

days during which a program may be 
brought into compliance. Programs not 
in compliance at the expiration of such 
period shall be terminated imme-
diately. 

(b) Any common carrier providing 
transmission or billing and collection 
services to a provider of interstate in-
formation service through any 800 tele-
phone number, or other telephone num-
ber advertised or widely understood to 
be toll-free, shall promptly investigate 
any complaint that such service is not 
provided in accordance with § 64.1504 or 
§ 64.1510(c), and, if the carrier reason-
ably determines that the complaint is 
valid, may terminate the provision of 
service to an information provider un-
less the provider supplies evidence of a 
written agreement that meets the re-
quirements of this § 64.1504(c)(1). 

[61 FR 39087, July 26, 1996] 

§ 64.1504 Restrictions on the use of 
toll-free numbers. 

A common carrier shall prohibit by 
tariff or contract the use of any 800 
telephone number, or other telephone 
number advertised or widely under-
stood to be toll-free, in a manner that 
would result in: 

(a) The calling party or the sub-
scriber to the originating line being as-
sessed, by virtue of completing the 
call, a charge for a call; 

(b) The calling party being connected 
to a pay-per-call service; 

(c) The calling party being charged 
for information conveyed during the 
call unless: 

(1) The calling party has a written 
agreement (including an agreement 
transmitted through electronic me-
dium) that specifies the material terms 
and conditions under which the infor-
mation is offered and includes: 

(i) The rate at which charges are as-
sessed for the information; 

(ii) The information provider’s name; 
(iii) The information provider’s busi-

ness address; 
(iv) The information provider’s reg-

ular business telephone number; 
(v) The information provider’s agree-

ment to notify the subscriber at least 
one billing cycle in advance of all fu-
ture changes in the rates charged for 
the information; 
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