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Federal Communications Commission § 63.71 

§ 63.66 Closure of or reduction of 
hours of service at telephone ex-
changes at military establishments. 

Where a carrier desires to close or re-
duce hours of service at a telephone ex-
change located at a military establish-
ment because of the deactivation of 
such establishment, it may, in lieu of 
filing formal application, file in quin-
tuplicate an informal request. Such re-
quest shall make reference to this sec-
tion and shall set forth the class of of-
fice, address, date of proposed closure 
or reduction, description of service to 
remain or be substituted, statement as 
to any difference in charges to the pub-
lic, and the reasons for the proposed 
closure or reduction. Authority for 
such closure or reduction shall be 
deemed to have been granted by the 
Commission, effective as of the 15th 
day following the date of filing of such 
request, unless, on or before the 15th 
day, the Commission shall notify the 
carrier to the contrary. 

[45 FR 6585, Jan. 29, 1980] 

§ 63.71 Procedures for discontinuance, 
reduction or impairment of service 
by domestic carriers. 

Any domestic carrier that seeks to 
discontinue, reduce or impair service 
shall be subject to the following proce-
dures: 

(a) The carrier shall notify all af-
fected customers of the planned dis-
continuance, reduction, or impairment 
of service and shall notify and submit a 
copy of its application to the public 
utility commission and to the Gov-
ernor of the State in which the dis-
continuance, reduction, or impairment 
of service is proposed, and also to the 
Secretary of Defense, Attn. Special As-
sistant for Telecommunications, Pen-
tagon, Washington, DC 20301. Notice 
shall be in writing to each affected cus-
tomer unless the Commission author-
izes in advance, for good cause shown, 
another form of notice. Notice shall in-
clude the following: 

(1) Name and address of carrier; 
(2) Date of planned service dis-

continuance, reduction or impairment; 
(3) Points of geographic areas of serv-

ice affected; 
(4) Brief description of type of service 

affected; and 
(5) One of the following statements: 

(i) If the carrier is non-dominant 
with respect to the service being dis-
continued, reduced or impaired, the no-
tice shall state: The FCC will normally 
authorize this proposed discontinuance 
of service (or reduction or impairment) 
unless it is shown that customers 
would be unable to receive service or a 
reasonable substitute from another 
carrier or that the public convenience 
and necessity is otherwise adversely af-
fected. If you wish to object, you 
should file your comments as soon as 
possible, but no later than 15 days after 
the Commission releases public notice 
of the proposed discontinuance. Ad-
dress them to the Federal Communica-
tions Commission, Wireline Competi-
tion Bureau, Competition Policy Divi-
sion, Washington, DC 20554, and include 
in your comments a reference to the 
§ 63.71 Application of (carrier’s name). 
Comments should include specific in-
formation about the impact of this pro-
posed discontinuance (or reduction or 
impairment) upon you or your com-
pany, including any inability to ac-
quire reasonable substitute service. 

(ii) If the carrier is dominant with re-
spect to the service being discontinued, 
reduced or impaired, the notice shall 
state: The FCC will normally authorize 
this proposed discontinuance of service 
(or reduction or impairment) unless it 
is shown that customers would be un-
able to receive service or a reasonable 
substitute from another carrier or that 
the public convenience and necessity is 
otherwise adversely affected. If you 
wish to object, you should file your 
comments as soon as possible, but no 
later than 30 days after the Commis-
sion releases public notice of the pro-
posed discontinuance. Address them to 
the Federal Communications Commis-
sion, Wireline Competition Bureau, 
Competition Policy Division, Wash-
ington, DC 20554, and include in your 
comments a reference to the § 63.71 Ap-
plication of (carrier’s name). Com-
ments should include specific informa-
tion about the impact of this proposed 
discontinuance (or reduction or impair-
ment) upon you or your company, in-
cluding any inability to acquire rea-
sonable substitute service. 

(b) The carrier shall file with this 
Commission, on or after the date on 
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