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local exchange carrier shall receive the 
following amount of high-cost support: 

(1) In the first year, two-thirds of the 
lesser of the incumbent’s total 2010 
high-cost support or $3000 times the 
number of reported lines as of year-end 
2010; 

(2) In the second year, one-third of 
the lesser of the incumbent’s total 2010 
high-cost support or $3000 times the 
number of reported lines as of year-end 
2010; 

(3) In the third year and thereafter, 
no support shall be paid. 

[79 FR 39190, July 9, 2014] 

§ 54.320 Compliance and record-
keeping for the high-cost program. 

(a) Eligible telecommunications car-
riers authorized to receive universal 
service high-cost support are subject to 
random compliance audits and other 
investigations to ensure compliance 
with program rules and orders. 

(b) All eligible telecommunications 
carriers shall retain all records re-
quired to demonstrate to auditors that 
the support received was consistent 
with the universal service high-cost 
program rules. This documentation 
must be maintained for at least ten 
years from the receipt of funding. All 
such documents shall be made avail-
able upon request to the Commission 
and any of its Bureaus or Offices, the 
Administrator, and their respective 
auditors. 

(c) Eligible telecommunications car-
riers authorized to receive high-cost 
support that fail to comply with public 
interest obligations or any other terms 
and conditions may be subject to fur-
ther action, including the Commis-
sion’s existing enforcement procedures 
and penalties, reductions in support 
amounts, potential revocation of ETC 
designation, and suspension or debar-
ment pursuant to § 54.8. 

[76 FR 73876, Nov. 29, 2011] 

Subpart E—Universal Service Sup-
port for Low-Income Con-
sumers 

54.400 Terms and definitions. 

As used in this subpart, the following 
terms shall be defined as follows: 

(a) Qualifying low-income consumer. A 
‘‘qualifying low-income consumer’’ is a 
consumer who meets the qualifications 
for Lifeline, as specified in § 54.409. 

(b) Toll blocking service. ‘‘Toll block-
ing service’’ is a service provided by an 
eligible telecommunications carrier 
that lets subscribers elect not to allow 
the completion of outgoing toll calls 
from their telecommunications chan-
nel. 

(c) Toll control service. ‘‘Toll control 
service’’ is a service provided by an eli-
gible telecommunications carrier that 
allows subscribers to specify a certain 
amount of toll usage that may be in-
curred on their telecommunications 
channel per month or per billing cycle. 

(d) Toll limitation service. ‘‘Toll limita-
tion service’’ denotes either toll block-
ing service or toll control service for 
eligible telecommunications carriers 
that are incapable of providing both 
services. For eligible telecommuni-
cations carriers that are capable of 
providing both services, ‘‘toll limita-
tion service’’ denotes both toll block-
ing service and toll control service. 

(e) Eligible resident of Tribal lands. An 
‘‘eligible resident of Tribal lands’’ is a 
‘‘qualifying low-income consumer,’’ as 
defined in paragraph (a) of this section, 
living on Tribal lands. For purposes of 
this subpart, ‘‘Tribal lands’’ include 
any federally recognized Indian tribe’s 
reservation, pueblo, or colony, includ-
ing former reservations in Oklahoma; 
Alaska Native regions established pur-
suant to the Alaska Native Claims Set-
tlement Act (85 Stat. 688); Indian allot-
ments; Hawaiian Home Lands—areas 
held in trust for Native Hawaiians by 
the state of Hawaii, pursuant to the 
Hawaiian Homes Commission Act, 1920 
July 9, 1921, 42 Stat. 108, et. seq., as 
amended; and any land designated as 
such by the Commission for purposes of 
this subpart pursuant to the designa-
tion process in § 54.412. 

(f) Income. ‘‘Income’’ is all income ac-
tually received by all members of a 
household. This includes salary before 
deductions for taxes, public assistance 
benefits, social security payments, 
pensions, unemployment compensa-
tion, veteran’s benefits, inheritances, 
alimony, child support payments, 
worker’s compensation benefits, gifts, 
lottery winnings, and the like. The 
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