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Federal Communications Commission § 51.907 

and intrastate rate elements for func-
tionally equivalent service. Tandem 
Switched Transport Access Service 
rate elements for a non-incumbent 
local exchange carrier include any 
functionally equivalent access service. 

(j) Transitional Intrastate Access Serv-
ice means terminating End Office Ac-
cess Service that was subject to intra-
state access rates as of December 31, 
2011; terminating Tandem-Switched 
Transport Access Service that was sub-
ject to intrastate access rates as of De-
cember 31, 2011; and originating and 
terminating Dedicated Transport Ac-
cess Service that was subject to intra-
state access rates as of December 31, 
2011. 

§ 51.905 Implementation. 
(a) The rates set forth in this section 

are default rates. Notwithstanding any 
other provision of the Commission’s 
rules, telecommunications carriers 
may agree to rates different from the 
default rates. 

(b) LECs who are otherwise required 
to file tariffs are required to tariff 
rates no higher than the default transi-
tional rates specified by this subpart. 

(1) With respect to interstate 
switched access services governed by 
this subpart, LECs shall tariff rates for 
those services in their federal tariffs. 
Except as expressly superseded below, 
LECs shall follow the procedures speci-
fied in part 61 of this chapter when fil-
ing such tariffs. 

(2) With respect to Transitional 
Intrastate Access Services governed by 
this subpart, LECs shall follow the pro-
cedures specified by relevant state law 
when filing such tariffs, price lists or 
other instrument (referred to collec-
tively as ‘‘tariffs’’). 

(c) Nothing in this section shall be 
construed to require a carrier to file or 
maintain a tariff or to amend an exist-
ing tariff if it is not otherwise required 
to do so under applicable law. 

§ 51.907 Transition of price cap carrier 
access charges. 

(a) Notwithstanding any other provi-
sion of the Commission’s rules, on De-
cember 29, 2011, a Price Cap Carrier 
shall cap the rates for all interstate 
and intrastate rate elements for serv-
ices contained in the definitions of 

Interstate End Office Access Services, 
Tandem Switched Transport Access 
Services, and Dedicated Transport Ac-
cess Services. In addition, a Price Cap 
Carrier shall also cap the rates for any 
interstate and intrastate rate elements 
in the traffic sensitive basket’’ and the 
‘‘trunking basket’’ as described in 47 
CFR 61.42(d)(2) and (3) to the extent 
that such rate elements are not con-
tained in the definitions of Interstate 
End Office Access Services, Tandem 
Switched Transport Access Services, 
and Dedicated Transport Access Serv-
ices. Carriers will remove these serv-
ices from price cap regulation in their 
July 1, 2012 annual tariff filing. 

(b) Step 1. Beginning July 1, 2012, not-
withstanding any other provision of 
the Commission’s rules: 

(1) Each Price Cap Carrier shall file 
tariffs, in accordance with § 51.905(b)(2), 
with the appropriate state regulatory 
authority, that set forth the rates ap-
plicable to Transitional Intrastate Ac-
cess Service in each state in which it 
provides Transitional Intrastate Access 
Service. 

(2) Each Price Cap Carrier shall es-
tablish the rates for Transitional 
Intrastate Access Service using the fol-
lowing methodology: 

(i) Calculate total revenue from 
Transitional Intrastate Access Service 
at the carrier’s interstate access rates 
in effect on December 29, 2011, using 
Fiscal Year 2011 intrastate switched ac-
cess demand for each rate element. 

(ii) Calculate total revenue from 
Transitional Intrastate Access Service 
at the carrier’s intrastate access rates 
in effect on December 29, 2011, using 
Fiscal Year 2011 intrastate switched ac-
cess demand for each rate element. 

(iii) Calculate the Step 1 Access Rev-
enue Reduction. The Step 1 Access 
Revenue Reduction is equal to one-half 
of the difference between the amount 
calculated in paragraph (b)(2)(i) of this 
section and the amount calculated in 
paragraph (b)(2)(ii) of this section. 

(iv) A Price Cap Carrier may elect to 
establish rates for Transitional Intra-
state Access Service using its intra-
state access rate structure. Carriers 
using this option shall establish rates 
for Transitional Intrastate Access 
Service such that Transitional Intra-
state Access Service revenue at the 
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