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(5) Dialed digit extraction. Capability 
that permits a LEA to receive on the 
call data channel digits dialed by a 
subject after a call is connected to an-
other carrier’s service for processing 
and routing. 

(6) Direction. A party or place to 
which a call is re-directed or the party 
or place from which it came, either in-
coming or outgoing (e.g., a redirected- 
to party or redirected-from party). 

(7) IAP. Intercept access point is a 
point within a carrier’s system where 
some of the communications or call- 
identifying information of an intercept 
subject’s equipment, facilities, and 
services are accessed. 

(8) In-band and out-of-band signaling. 
Capability that permits a LEA to be in-
formed when a network message that 
provides call identifying information 
(e.g., ringing, busy, call waiting signal, 
message light) is generated or sent by 
the IAP switch to a subject using the 
facilities under surveillance. Excludes 
signals generated by customer prem-
ises equipment when no network signal 
is generated. 

(9) J–STD–025. The standard, includ-
ing the latest version, developed by the 
Telecommunications Industry Associa-
tion (TIA) and the Alliance for Tele-
communications Industry Solutions 
(ATIS) for wireline, cellular, and 
broadband PCS carriers. This standard 
defines services and features to support 
lawfully authorized electronic surveil-
lance, and specifies interfaces nec-
essary to deliver intercepted commu-
nications and call-identifying informa-
tion to a LEA. Subsequently, TIA and 
ATIS published J–STD–025–A and J– 
STD–025–B. 

(10) Origin. A party initiating a call 
(e.g., a calling party), or a place from 
which a call is initiated. 

(11) Party hold, join, drop on con-
ference calls. Capability that permits a 
LEA to identify the parties to a con-
ference call conversation at all times. 

(12) Subject-initiated dialing and sig-
naling information. Capability that per-
mits a LEA to be informed when a sub-
ject using the facilities under surveil-
lance uses services that provide call 
identifying information, such as call 
forwarding, call waiting, call hold, and 
three-way calling. Excludes signals 
generated by customer premises equip-

ment when no network signal is gen-
erated. 

(13) Termination. A party or place at 
the end of a communication path (e.g. 
the called or call-receiving party, or 
the switch of a party that has placed 
another party on hold). 

(14) Timing information. Capability 
that permits a LEA to associate call- 
identifying information with the con-
tent of a call. A call-identifying mes-
sage must be sent from the carrier’s 
IAP to the LEA’s Collection Function 
within eight seconds of receipt of that 
message by the IAP at least 95% of the 
time, and with the call event time- 
stamped to an accuracy of at least 200 
milliseconds. 

(b) In addition to the requirements in 
§ 1.20006, wireline, cellular, and PCS 
telecommunications carriers shall pro-
vide to a LEA the assistance capability 
requirements regarding wire and elec-
tronic communications and call identi-
fying information covered by J–STD– 
025 (current version), and, subject to 
the definitions in this section, may sat-
isfy these requirements by complying 
with J–STD–025 (current version), or by 
another means of their own choosing. 
These carriers also shall provide to a 
LEA the following capabilities: 

(1) Content of subject-initiated con-
ference calls; 

(2) Party hold, join, drop on con-
ference calls; 

(3) Subject-initiated dialing and sig-
naling information; 

(4) In-band and out-of-band signaling; 
(5) Timing information; 
(6) Dialed digit extraction, with a 

toggle feature that can activate/deacti-
vate this capability. 

[71 FR 38108, July 5, 2006, as amended at 76 
FR 70911, Nov. 16, 2011] 

§ 1.20008 Penalties. 

In the event of a telecommunications 
carrier’s violation of this subchapter, 
the Commission shall enforce the pen-
alties articulated in 47 U.S.C. 503(b) of 
the Communications Act of 1934 and 47 
CFR 1.80. 
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