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of the decision in the proceeding, but 
in no case later than 30 days after the 
Commission’s final disposition of the 
proceeding. 

(b) If review or reconsideration is 
sought or taken of a decision as to 
which an applicant believes it has pre-
vailed, proceedings for the award of 
fees shall be stayed pending final dis-
position of the underlying controversy. 

(c) For purposes of this rule, final dis-
position means the later of 

(1) The date on which an initial deci-
sion or other recommended disposition 
of the merits of the proceeding by an 
Administrative Law Judge becomes ad-
ministratively final; 

(2) Issuance of an order disposing of 
any petitions for reconsideration of the 
Commission’s order in the proceeding; 

(3) If no petition for reconsideration 
is filed, the last date on which such pe-
tition could have been filed; 

(4) Issuance of a final order by the 
Commission or any other final resolu-
tion of a proceeding, such as settle-
ment or voluntary dismissal, which is 
not subject to a petition for reconsider-
ation, or to a petition for judicial re-
view; or 

(5) Completion of judicial action on 
the underlying controversy and any 
subsequent Commission action pursu-
ant to judicial mandate. 

[47 FR 3786, Jan. 27, 1982, as amended at 61 
FR 39899, July 31, 1996] 

PROCEDURES FOR CONSIDERING 
APPLICATIONS 

§ 1.1521 Filing and service of docu-
ments. 

Any application for an award or 
other pleading relating to an applica-
tion shall be filed and served on all par-
ties to the proceeding in the same man-
ner as other pleadings in the pro-
ceeding, except as provided in § 1.1512(b) 
for confidential financial information. 

§ 1.1522 Answer to application. 

(a) Within 30 days after service of an 
application Bureau counsel may file an 
answer to the application. Unless Bu-
reau counsel requests an extension of 
time for filing or files a statement of 
intent to negotiate under paragraph (b) 
of this section, failure to file an answer 

within the 30-day period may be treat-
ed as a consent to the award request. 

(b) If Bureau counsel and the appli-
cant believe that the issues in the fee 
application can be settled, they may 
jointly file a statement of their intent 
to negotiate a settlement. The filing of 
this statement shall extend the time 
for filing an answer for an additional 30 
days, and further extensions may be 
granted by the Administrative Law 
Judge upon request by Bureau counsel 
and the applicant. 

(c) The answer shall explain in detail 
any objections to the award requested 
and identify the facts relied on in sup-
port of Bureau counsel’s position. If 
the answer is based on any alleged 
facts not already in the record of the 
proceeding, Bureau counsel shall in-
clude with the answer either sup-
porting affidavits or a request for fur-
ther proceedings under § 1.1526. 

§ 1.1523 Reply. 
Within 15 days after service of an an-

swer, the applicant may file a reply. If 
the reply is based on any alleged facts 
not already in the record of the pro-
ceeding, the applicant shall include 
with the reply either supporting affida-
vits or a request for further pro-
ceedings under § 1.1526. 

§ 1.1524 Comments by other parties. 
Any party to a proceeding other than 

the applicant and Bureau counsel may 
file comments on an application within 
30 days after it is served or an answer 
within 15 days after it is served. A com-
menting party may not participate fur-
ther in proceedings on the application 
unless the Administrative Law Judge 
determines that the public interest re-
quires such participation in order to 
permit full exploration of matters 
raised in the comments. 

[47 FR 3786, Jan. 27, 1982, as amended at 61 
FR 39899, July 31, 1996] 

§ 1.1525 Settlement. 
The applicant and Bureau counsel 

may agree on a proposed settlement of 
the award before final action on the ap-
plication, either in connection with a 
settlement of the underlying pro-
ceeding, or after the underlying pro-
ceeding has been concluded. If a pre-
vailing party and Bureau counsel agree 
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