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(2) Parties qualified for installment 
payment plans. 

(i) Where both parties to a parti-
tioning or disaggregation agreement 
qualify for installment payments, the 
partitionee or disaggregatee will be 
permitted to make installment pay-
ments on its portion of the remaining 
government obligation. 

(ii) Each party may be required, as a 
condition to approval of the partial as-
signment application, to execute loan 
documents agreeing to pay its pro rata 
portion of the outstanding principal 
balance due, as apportioned according 
to § 1.2111(e)(3) of this chapter, based 
upon the installment payment terms 
for which it qualifies under the rules. 
Failure by either party to meet this 
condition will result in the automatic 
cancellation of the grant of the partial 
assignment application. The interest 
rate, established pursuant to 
§ 1.2110(f)(3)(i) of this chapter at the 
time of the grant of the initial license 
in the market, shall continue to be ap-
plied to both parties’ portion of the 
balance due. Each party will receive a 
license for its portion of the parti-
tioned market. 

(iii) A default on an obligation will 
affect only that portion of the market 
area held by the defaulting party. 

(d) Construction requirements—(1) Par-
titioning. Partial assignors and assign-
ees for license partitioning have two 
options to meet construction require-
ments. Under the first option, the 
partitionor and partitionee would each 
certify that they will independently 
satisfy the applicable construction re-
quirements set forth in § 95.833 of this 
part for their respective partitioned 
areas. If either licensee failed to meet 
its requirement in § 95.833 of this part, 
only the non-performing licensee’s re-
newal application would be subject to 
dismissal. Under the second option, the 
partitionor certifies that it has met or 
will meet the requirement in § 95.833 of 
this part for the entire market. If the 
partitionor fails to meet the require-
ment in § 95.833 of this part, however, 
only its renewal application would be 
subject to forfeiture at renewal. 

(2) Disaggregation. Partial assignors 
and assignees for license 
disaggregation have two options to 
meet construction requirements. Under 

the first option, the disaggregator and 
disaggregatee would certify that they 
each will share responsibility for meet-
ing the applicable construction re-
quirements set forth in § 95.833 of this 
part for the geographic service area. If 
parties choose this option and either 
party fails to do so, both licenses would 
be subject to forfeiture at renewal. The 
second option would allow the parties 
to agree that either the disaggregator 
or the disaggregatee would be respon-
sible for meeting the requirement in 
§ 95.833 of this part for the geographic 
service area. If parties choose this op-
tion, and the party responsible for 
meeting the construction requirement 
fails to do so, only the license of the 
non-performing party would be subject 
to forfeiture at renewal. 

(3) All applications requesting partial 
assignments of license for partitioning 
or disaggregation must include the 
above-referenced certification as to 
which of the construction options is se-
lected. 

(4) Responsible parties must submit 
supporting documents showing compli-
ance with the respective construction 
requirements within the appropriate 
construction benchmarks set forth in 
§ 95.833 of this part. 

[64 FR 59662, Nov. 3, 1999, as amended at 67 
FR 46378, July 9, 2002] 

SYSTEM REQUIREMENTS 

§ 95.831 Service requirements. 
Subject to the initial construction 

requirements of § 95.833 of this subpart, 
each 218–219 MHz Service system li-
cense must demonstrate that it pro-
vides substantial service within the 
service area. Substantial service is de-
fined as a service that is sound, favor-
able, and substantially above a level of 
service which might minimally war-
rant renewal. 

[64 FR 59662, Nov. 3, 1999] 

§ 95.833 Construction requirements. 
(a) Each 218–219 MHz Service licensee 

must make a showing of ‘‘substantial 
service’’ within ten years of the license 
grant. A ‘‘substantial service’’ assess-
ment will be made at renewal pursuant 
to the provisions and procedures con-
tained in § 1.949 of this chapter. 
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