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(1) Advances from affiliated compa-
nies; 

(2) Advances from nonaffiliated com-
panies and other liabilities; 

(3) Assessments for public improve-
ments past due; 

(4) Bond coupons, matured and un-
paid; 

(5) Claims and judgments; 
(6) Customers’ deposits; 
(7) Funded debt mature, with respect 

to which a definite agreement as to ex-
tension has not been made; 

(8) Notes payable on demand or ma-
turing one year or less from date of 
issue; 

(9) Open accounts; 
(10) Tax assessments, past due; and 
(11) Discount, premium, and issuance 

expense of notes maturing one year or 
less from date of issue. 

[67 FR 5699, Feb. 6, 2002] 

§ 32.7600 Extraordinary items. 

(a) This account is intended to seg-
regate the effects of events or trans-
actions that are extraordinary. Ex-
traordinary events and transactions 
are distinguished by both their unusual 
nature and by the infrequency of their 
occurrence, taking into account the en-
vironment in which the company oper-
ates. This account shall also include 
the related income tax effect of the ex-
traordinary items. 

(b) This account shall be credited 
and/or charged with nontypical, non-
customary and infrequently recurring 
gains and/or losses which would signifi-
cantly distort the current year’s in-
come computed before such extraor-
dinary items, if reported other than as 
extraordinary items. 

(c) This account shall be charged or 
credited and Account 4070, Income 
taxes—accrued, shall be credited or 
charged for all current income tax ef-
fects (Federal, state and local) of ex-
traordinary items. 

(d) This account shall also be charged 
or credited, as appropriate, with a 
contra amount recorded to Account 
4350, Net noncurrent deferred nonop-
erating income taxes or Account 4110, 
Net current deferred nonoperating in-
come taxes for the income tax effects 
(Federal, state and local) of extraor-

dinary items that have been deferred in 
accordance with § 32.22. 

[67 FR 5700, Feb. 6, 2002] 

§ 32.7899 Content of accounts. 
Jurisdictional differences and non-

regulated income amounts shall be in-
cluded in Accounts 7910 and 7990. 

§ 32.7910 Income effect of jurisdic-
tional ratemaking differences—net. 

This account shall include the im-
pact on revenues and expenses of the 
jurisdictional ratemaking practices 
which vary from those of this Commis-
sion. All entries recorded in this ac-
count shall be recorded net of the ap-
plicable income tax effects and shall be 
supported by appropriate subsidiary 
records, where necessary, as provided 
for in § 32.13(e) of subpart B. 

§ 32.7990 Nonregulated net income. 
(a) This account shall be used by 

those companies who offer nonregu-
lated activities that do not involve the 
joint or common use of assets or re-
sources used in the provision of both 
regulated and nonregulated products 
and services, and which have not estab-
lished a separate subsidiary for that 
purpose. 

(b) All revenue and expenses (includ-
ing taxes) incurred in these nonregu-
lated activities shall be recorded on 
separate books of account for such op-
erations. Only the net of the total reve-
nues and total expenses shall be re-
corded in this account, with a contra 
debit or credit to account 1406.3. 

[52 FR 6562, Mar. 4, 1987] 

Subpart G—Glossary 
§ 32.9000 Glossary of terms. 

When used in this system of ac-
counts: 

Accelerated depreciation means a de-
preciation method or period of time, 
including the treatment given cost of 
removal and gross salvage, used in cal-
culating depreciation deductions on in-
come tax returns which is different 
from the depreciation method or period 
of time prescribed by this Commission 
for use in calculating depreciation ex-
pense recorded in a company’s books of 
account. 
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