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(g) The classification of deferred in-
come taxes as current or noncurrent 
shall follow the classification of the 
asset or liability that gave rise to de-
ferred income tax. If there is no related 
asset or liability, classification shall 
be based on the expected turnaround of 
the temporary differences. 

(h) Subsidiary record categories shall 
be maintained in order that the com-
pany may separately report the 
amounts contained herein that are 
property related and those that are 
nonproperty related. Such subsidiary 
record categories shall be reported as 
required by part 43 of this Commis-
sion’s Rules and Regulations. 

[51 FR 43499, Dec. 2, 1986, as amended at 59 
FR 9419, Feb. 28, 1994; 67 FR 5689, Feb. 6, 2002] 

§ 32.4130 Other current liabilities. 

This account shall include: 
(a) The amount of advance billing 

creditable to revenue accounts in fu-
ture months; also advance payments 
made by prospective customers prior to 
the establishment of service. Amounts 
included in this account shall be cred-
ited to the appropriate revenue ac-
counts in the months in which the 
service is rendered or cleared from this 
account as refunds are made. 

(b) The amount (including any obli-
gations for premiums) of long-term 
debt matured and unpaid without any 
specific agreement for extension of ma-
turity, including unpresented bonds 
drawn for redemption through the op-
eration of sinking and redemption fund 
agreements. 

(c) The current portion of obligations 
applicable to property obtained under 
capital leases. 

(d) The amount of wages, com-
pensated absences, interest on indebt-
edness of the company, dividends on 
capital stock, and rents accrued to the 
date for which the balance sheet is 
made, but not payable until after that 
date. Accruals shall be maintained so 
as to show separately the amount and 
nature of the items accrued to the date 
of the balance sheet. 

(e) Matured rents, dividends, interest 
payable under monthly settlements on 
short-term loans, advances, and open 
accounts shall be included in Account 
4000. 

(f) All other liabilities of current 
character which are not included in Ac-
count 4000 through 4110. 

[67 FR 5689, Feb. 6, 2002] 

§ 32.4200 Long term debt and funded 
debt. 

(a) This account shall include: 
(1) The total face amount of 

unmatured debt maturing more than 
one year from date of issue, issued by 
the company and not retired, and the 
total face amount of similar 
unmatured debt of other companies, 
the payment of which has been as-
sumed by the company, including fund-
ed debt the maturity of which has been 
extended by specific agreement. This 
account shall also include such items 
as mortgage bonds, collateral trust 
bonds, income bonds, convertible debt, 
debt securities with detachable war-
rants and other similar obligations ma-
turing more than one year from date of 
issue. 

(2) The premium associated with all 
classes of long-term debt. Premium, as 
applied to securities issued or assumed 
by the company, means the excess of 
the current money value received at 
their sale over the sum of their book or 
face amount and interest or dividends 
accrued at the date of the sale. 

(3) The discount associated with all 
classes of long-term debt. Discount, as 
applied to securities issued or assumed 
by the company, means the excess of 
the book or face amount of the securi-
ties plus interest or dividends accrued 
at the date of the sale over the current 
money value of the consideration re-
ceived at their sale. 

(4) The face amount of debt reac-
quired prior to maturity that has not 
been retired. Gain or loss shall be rec-
ognized at the time of reacquisition by 
credits or charges to Account 7300, 
Nonoperating income and expense, ex-
cept that material gains or losses shall 
be treated as extraordinary. (See Ac-
count 7600, Extraordinary items.) 

(5) The noncurrent portion of obliga-
tions applicable to property obtained 
under capital leases. Amounts subject 
to current settlement shall be included 
in Account 4130, Other current liabil-
ities. 

VerDate Mar<15>2010 19:20 Nov 14, 2012 Jkt 226206 PO 00000 Frm 00454 Fmt 8010 Sfmt 8010 Q:\47\47V2.TXT ofr150 PsN: PC150



445 

Federal Communications Commission § 32.4340 

(6) The amount of advance from af-
filiated companies. Amounts due affili-
ated companies which are subject to 
current settlement shall be included in 
Account 4000. 

(7) Investment advances, including 
those represented by notes. 

(8) Long-term debt not provided for 
elsewhere. 

(b) Subsidiary records shall be main-
tained for each issue. The subsidiary 
records shall identify the premium or 
discount attributable to each issue. 

(c) Premiums and discounts on long- 
term debt recorded in this account 
shall be amortized monthly by the in-
terest method and charged or credited, 
as appropriate, to Account 7500, Inter-
est and related items. 

(d) Debt securities with detachable 
warrants shall be accounted for in ac-
cordance with generally accepted ac-
counting principles. 

(e) Securities maturing in one year 
or less, including securities maturing 
serially, shall be included in Account 
4130, Other current liabilities. 

[67 FR 5689, Feb. 6, 2002] 

§ 32.4300 Other long-term liabilities 
and deferred credits. 

(a) This account shall include 
amounts accrued to provide for such 
items as unfunded pensions (if actuari-
ally determined), death benefits, de-
ferred compensation costs and other 
long-term liabilities not provided for 
elsewhere. Subsidiary records shall be 
maintained to identify the nature of 
these items. 

(b) This account shall include the 
amount of all deferred credits not pro-
vided for elsewhere, such as amounts 
awaiting adjustment between accounts; 
and revenue, expense, and income 
items in suspense. 

[67 FR 5690, Feb. 6, 2002] 

§ 32.4320 Unamortized operating in-
vestment tax credits—net. 

(a) This account shall be credited and 
Account 7210, Operating Investment 
Tax Credits—Net, should be debited 
with investment tax credits generated 
from qualified expenditures related to 
regulated operations which the com-
pany defers rather than recognizes cur-
rently in income. 

(b) This account shall be debited and 
Account 7210 credited with a propor-
tionate amount determined in relation 
to the period of time used for com-
puting book depreciation on the prop-
erty to which the tax credit relates. 

§ 32.4330 Unamortized nonoperating 
investment tax credits—net. 

(a) This account shall be credited and 
Account 7400, Nonoperating Taxes, 
shall be debited with investment tax 
credits generated from qualified ex-
penditures related to other operations 
which the company has elected to defer 
rather than recognize currently in in-
come. 

(b) This account shall be debited and 
Account 7400 credited with a propor-
tionate amount determined in relation 
to the useful book life of the property 
to which the tax credit relates. 

[67 FR 5690, Feb. 6, 2002] 

§ 32.4340 Net noncurrent deferred op-
erating income taxes. 

(a) This account shall include the 
balance of income tax expense related 
to noncurrent items from regulated op-
erations which have been deferred to 
later periods as a result of comprehen-
sive interperiod tax allocation related 
to temporary differences that arise 
from regulated operations. 

(b) This account shall be credited or 
debited, as appropriate, and Account 
7250, Provision for Deferred Operating 
Income Taxes—Net, shall reflect the 
offset for the tax effect of revenues and 
expenses from regulated operations 
which have been included in the deter-
mination of taxable income, but which 
will not be included in the determina-
tion of book income or for the tax ef-
fect of revenues and expenses from reg-
ulated operations which have been in-
cluded in the determination of book in-
come prior to the inclusion in the de-
termination of taxable income. 

(c) As regulated assets or liabilities 
which generated the prepaid income 
tax or deferred income tax are reclassi-
fied from long-term or noncurrent sta-
tus to current status, the appropriate 
deferred income tax shall be reclassi-
fied from this account to Account 4100, 
Net Current Deferred Operating Income 
Taxes. 
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