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Federal Communications Commission § 64.1601 

contributions are solicited has been 
granted tax exempt status by the In-
ternal Revenue Service. 

§ 64.1514 Generation of signalling 
tones. 

No common carrier shall assign a 
telephone number for any pay-per-call 
service that employs broadcast adver-
tising which generates the audible 
tones necessary to complete a call to a 
pay-per-call service. 

§ 64.1515 Recovery of costs. 
No common carrier shall recover its 

cost of complying with the provisions 
of this subpart from local or long dis-
tance ratepayers. 

Subpart P—Calling Party 
Telephone Number; Privacy 

SOURCE: 59 FR 18319, Apr. 18, 1994, unless 
otherwise noted. 

§ 64.1600 Definitions. 
(a) Aggregate information. The term 

‘‘aggregate information’’ means collec-
tive data that relate to a group or cat-
egory of services or customers, from 
which individual customer identities or 
characteristics have been removed. 

(b) ANI. The term ‘‘ANI’’ (automatic 
number identification) refers to the de-
livery of the calling party’s billing 
number by a local exchange carrier to 
any interconnecting carrier for billing 
or routing purposes, and to the subse-
quent delivery of such number to end 
users. 

(c) Calling party number. The term 
‘‘Calling Party Number’’ refers to the 
subscriber line number or the directory 
number contained in the calling party 
number parameter of the call set-up 
message associated with an interstate 
call on a Signaling System 7 network. 

(d) Charge number. The term ‘‘charge 
number’’ refers to the delivery of the 
calling party’s billing number in a Sig-
naling System 7 environment by a 
local exchange carrier to any inter-
connecting carrier for billing or rout-
ing purposes, and to the subsequent de-
livery of such number to end users. 

(e) Privacy indicator. The term ‘‘Pri-
vacy Indicator’’ refers to information, 
contained in the calling party number 
parameter of the call set-up message 

associated with an interstate call on an 
Signaling System 7 network, that indi-
cates whether the calling party author-
izes presentation of the calling party 
number to the called party. 

(f) Signaling System 7. The term ‘‘Sig-
naling System 7’’ (SS7) refers to a car-
rier to carrier out-of-band signaling 
network used for call routing, billing 
and management. 

[60 FR 29490, June 5, 1995] 

§ 64.1601 Delivery requirements and 
privacy restrictions. 

(a) Delivery. Except as provided in 
paragraph (d) of this section, common 
carriers using Signaling System 7 and 
offering or subscribing to any service 
based on Signaling System 7 
functionality are required to transmit 
the calling party number (CPN) associ-
ated with an interstate call to inter-
connecting carriers. 

(b) Privacy. Except as provided in 
paragraph (d) of this section, origi-
nating carriers using Signaling System 
7 and offering or subscribing to any 
service based on Signaling System 7 
functionality will recognize *67 dialed 
as the first three digits of a call (or 
1167 for rotary or pulse dialing phones) 
as a caller’s request that the CPN not 
be passed on an interstate call. Such 
carriers providing line blocking serv-
ices will recognize *82 as a caller’s re-
quest that the CPN be passed on an 
interstate call. No common carrier sub-
scribing to or offering any service that 
delivers CPN may override the privacy 
indicator associated with an interstate 
call. Carriers must arrange their CPN- 
based services, and billing practices, in 
such a manner that when a caller re-
quests that the CPN not be passed, a 
carrier may not reveal that caller’s 
number or name, nor may the carrier 
use the number or name to allow the 
called party to contact the calling 
party. The terminating carrier must 
act in accordance with the privacy in-
dicator unless the call is made to a 
called party that subscribes to an ANI 
or charge number based service and the 
call is paid for by the called party. 

(c) Charges. No common carrier sub-
scribing to or offering any service that 
delivers calling party number may 

VerDate Nov<24>2008 12:45 Nov 16, 2009 Jkt 217202 PO 00000 Frm 00329 Fmt 8010 Sfmt 8010 Y:\SGML\217202.XXX 217202er
ow

e 
on

 D
S

K
5C

LS
3C

1P
R

O
D

 w
ith

 C
F

R


		Superintendent of Documents
	2010-04-22T10:52:25-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




