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shall not be eligible for discount serv-
ices under the federal universal service 
support mechanism for schools and li-
braries until such certifications are 
submitted. 

(2) Consortia. A billed entity’s know-
ing failure to collect the required cer-
tifications from its eligible school and 
library members or knowing failure to 
certify that it collected the required 
certifications shall render the entire 
consortium ineligible for discounts 
under the federal universal service sup-
port mechanism for school and librar-
ies. 

(3) Reestablishing eligibility. At any 
time, a school or library deemed ineli-
gible for discount services under the 
federal universal service support mech-
anism for schools and libraries because 
of failure to submit certifications re-
quired by this section, may reestablish 
eligibility for discounts by providing 
the required certifications to the Ad-
ministrator and the Commission. 

(e) Failure to comply with the certifi-
cations—(1) Schools and libraries. A 
school or library that knowingly fails 
to ensure the use of computers in ac-
cordance with the certifications re-
quired by this section, must reimburse 
any funds and discounts received under 
the federal universal service support 
mechanism for schools and libraries for 
the period in which there was non-
compliance. 

(2) Consortia. In the case of consor-
tium applications, the eligibility for 
discounts of consortium members who 
ensure the use of computers in accord-
ance with the certification require-
ments of this section shall not be af-
fected by the failure of other school or 
library consortium members to ensure 
the use of computers in accordance 
with such requirements. 

(3) Reestablishing compliance. At any 
time, a school or library deemed ineli-
gible for discounts under the federal 
universal service support mechanism 
for schools and libraries for failure to 
ensure the use of computers in accord-
ance with the certification require-
ments of this section and that has been 
directed to reimburse the program for 
discounts received during the period of 
noncompliance, may reestablish com-
pliance by ensuring the use of its com-
puters in accordance with the certifi-

cation requirements under this section. 
Upon submittal to the Commission of a 
certification or other appropriate evi-
dence of such remedy, the school or li-
brary shall be eligible for discounts 
under the universal service mechanism. 

(f) Waivers based on state or local pro-
curement rules and regulations and com-
petitive bidding requirements. Waivers 
shall be granted to schools and librar-
ies when the authority responsible for 
making the certifications required by 
this section, cannot make the required 
certifications because its state or local 
procurement rules or regulations or 
competitive bidding requirements, pre-
vent the making of the certification 
otherwise required. The waiver shall be 
granted upon the provision, by the au-
thority responsible for making the cer-
tifications on behalf of schools or li-
braries, that the schools or libraries 
will be brought into compliance with 
the requirements of this section, for 
schools, before the start of the third 
program year after April 20, 2001 in 
which the school is applying for funds 
under this title, and, for libraries, be-
fore the start of Funding Year 2005 or 
the third program year after April 20, 
2001, whichever is later. 

(g) Funding year certification dead-
lines. For Funding Year 2003 and for 
subsequent funding years, billed enti-
ties shall provide one of the certifi-
cations required under paragraph (c)(1), 
(c)(2) or (c)(3) of this section on an FCC 
Form 486 in accordance with the exist-
ing program guidelines established by 
the Administrator. 

[66 FR 19396, Apr. 16, 2001; 66 FR 22133, May 3, 
2001, as amended at 67 FR 50603, Aug. 5, 2002; 
68 FR 47255, Aug. 8, 2003] 

§ 54.522 Eligible services list. 

The Administrator shall submit by 
June 30 of each year a draft list of serv-
ices eligible for support, based on the 
Commission’s rules, in the following 
funding year. The Commission will 
issue a Public Notice seeking comment 
on the Administrator’s proposed eligi-
ble services list. At least 60 days prior 
to the opening of the window for the 
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following funding year, the Commis-
sion shall release a Public Notice at-
taching the final eligible services list 
for the upcoming funding year. 

[69 FR 6191, Feb. 10, 2004] 

§ 54.523 Payment for the non-discount 
portion of supported services. 

An eligible school, library, or consor-
tium must pay the non-discount por-
tion of services or products purchased 
with universal service discounts. An el-
igible school, library, or consortium 
may not receive rebates for services or 
products purchased with universal 
service discounts. For the purpose of 
this rule, the provision, by the provider 
of a supported service, of free services 
or products unrelated to the supported 
service or product constitutes a rebate 
of the non-discount portion of the sup-
ported services. 

[69 FR 6192, Feb. 10, 2004] 

Subpart G—Universal Service 
Support for Health Care Providers 

§ 54.601 Eligibility. 

(a) Health care providers. (1) Except 
with regard to those services provided 
under § 54.621(b), only an entity that is 
either a public or non-profit rural 
health care provider, as defined in this 
section, shall be eligible to receive sup-
ported services under this subpart. 

(2) For purposes of this subpart, a 
‘‘health care provider’’ is any: 

(i) Post-secondary educational insti-
tution offering health care instruction, 
including a teaching hospital or med-
ical school; 

(ii) Community health center or 
health center providing health care to 
migrants; 

(iii) Local health department or 
agency; 

(iv) Community mental health cen-
ter; 

(v) Not-for-profit hospital; 
(vi) Rural health clinic; or 
(vii) Consortium of health care pro-

viders consisting of one or more enti-
ties described in paragraphs (a)(2)(i) 
through (a)(2)(vi) of this section. 

(3) For purposes of this subpart, a 
rural health care provider is a public or 
non-profit health care provider located 

in a rural area, as defined in this sub-
part. 

(i) Any health care provider that was 
located in a rural area under the defini-
tion used by the Commission prior to 
July 1, 2005, and that had received a 
funding commitment from USAC since 
1998, remain eligible for support under 
this subpart though the funding year 
ending on June 30, 2011. 

(ii) [Reserved] 
(4) Each separate site or location of a 

health care provider shall be consid-
ered an individual health care provider 
for purposes of calculating and lim-
iting support under this subpart. 

(b) Consortia. (1) An eligible health 
care provider may join a consortium 
with other eligible health care pro-
viders; with schools, libraries, and li-
brary consortia eligible under Subpart 
F; and with public sector (govern-
mental) entities to order telecommuni-
cations services. With one exception, 
eligible health care providers partici-
pating in consortia with ineligible pri-
vate sector members shall not be eligi-
ble for supported services under this 
subpart. A consortium may include in-
eligible private sector entities if such 
consortium is only receiving services 
at tariffed rates or at market rates 
from those providers who do not file 
tariffs. 

(2) For consortia, universal service 
support under this subpart shall apply 
only to the portion of eligible services 
used by an eligible health care pro-
vider. 

(c) Services. (1) Any telecommuni-
cations service that is the subject of a 
properly completed bona fide request 
by a rural health care provider shall be 
eligible for universal service support, 
subject to the limitations described in 
this paragraph. The length of a sup-
ported telecommunications service 
may not exceed the distance between 
the health care provider and the point 
farthest from that provider on the ju-
risdictional boundary of the largest 
city in a state as defined in § 54.625(a). 

(2) Internet access and limited toll-free 
access to internet. (i) For purposes of 
this subpart, eligible Internet access is 
an information service that enables 
rural health care providers to post 
their own data, interact with stored 
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