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(iv) Stations within 80 kilometers (50 
statute miles) with 25 kW or more av-
erage ERP in the primary plane of po-
larization in the azimuthal direction of 
the Monitoring Station; 

(4) Advance coordination for stations 
operating above 1000 MHz is rec-
ommended only where the proposed 
station is in the vicinity of a moni-
toring station designated as a satellite 
monitoring facility in § 0.121(c) of the 
Commission’s Rules and also meets the 
criteria outlined in paragraphs (e)(2) 
and (3) of this section. 

(5) The Commission will not screen 
applications to determine whether ad-
vance consultation has taken place. 
However, applicants are advised that 
such consultation can avoid objections 
from the Federal Communications 
Commission or modification of any au-
thorization which will cause harmful 
interference. 

(f) Any applicant for a new perma-
nent base or fixed station to be located 
on the islands of Puerto Rico, 
Desecheo, Mona, Vieques, and Culebra, 
or for a modification of an existing au-
thorization which would change the 
frequency, power, antenna height, di-
rectivity, or location of a station on 
these islands and would increase the 
likelihood of the authorized facility 
causing interference, shall notify the 
Interference Office, Arecibo Observ-
atory, HC3 Box 53995, Arecibo, Puerto 
Rico 00612, in writing or electronically, 
of the technical parameters of the pro-
posal. Applicants may wish to consult 
interference guidelines, which will be 
provided by Cornell University. Appli-
cants who choose to transmit informa-
tion electronically should e-mail to: 
prcz@naic.edu. 

(1) The notification to the Inter-
ference Office, Arecibo Observatory 
shall be made prior to, or simulta-
neously with, the filing of the applica-
tion with the Commission. The notifi-
cation shall state the geographical co-
ordinates of the antenna (NAD–83 
datum), antenna height above ground, 
ground elevation at the antenna, an-
tenna directivity and gain, proposed 
frequency and FCC Rule Part, type of 
emission, effective radiated power, and 
whether the proposed use is itinerant. 
Generally, submission of the informa-
tion in the technical portion of the 

FCC license application is adequate no-
tification. In addition, the applicant 
shall indicate in its application to the 
Commission the date notification was 
made to the Arecibo Observatory. 

(2) After receipt of such applications, 
the Commission will allow the Arecibo 
Observatory a period of 20 days for 
comments or objections in response to 
the notification indicated. The appli-
cant will be required to make reason-
able efforts in order to resolve or miti-
gate any potential interference prob-
lem with the Arecibo Observatory and 
to file either an amendment to the ap-
plication or a modification application, 
as appropriate. If the Commission de-
termines that an applicant has satis-
fied its responsibility to make reason-
able efforts to protect the Observatory 
from interference, its application may 
be granted. 

(3) The provisions of this paragraph 
do not apply to operations that trans-
mit on frequencies above 15 GHz. 

[28 FR 13032, Dec. 5, 1963, as amended at 42 
FR 8329, Feb. 9, 1977; 42 FR 27894, June 1, 1977; 
44 FR 77167, Dec. 31, 1979; 50 FR 39002, Sept. 
26, 1985; 58 FR 44904, Aug. 25, 1993; 61 FR 8477, 
Mar. 5, 1996; 62 FR 55530, Oct. 27, 1997; 70 FR 
31373, June 1, 2005] 

§ 23.21 Communications by inter-
national control stations. 

Stations in the international fixed 
public control service are authorized to 
communicate between transmitting 
stations, receiving stations, message 
centers or control points operating in 
the international fixed public 
radiocommunication services for the 
purpose of handling service messages 
or international traffic between these 
points: Provided, That only traffic orig-
inating in or destined to points outside 
the contiguous states may be handled. 
Frequencies in bands designated for 
international control stations in Part 2 
of this chapter may be assigned to 
these stations. 

[38 FR 22480, Aug. 21, 1973] 

§ 23.23 Use of frequencies for radio- 
telegraph communication within 
the continental United States. 

Licensees of point-to-point radio-
telegraph stations may use any fre-
quency authorized in a station license 
for communication between designated 
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