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§ 101.407 Special procedure for the de-
velopment of a new service or for 
the use of frequencies not in ac-
cordance with the provisions of the 
rules in this part. 

(a) An authorization for the develop-
ment of a new service not in accord-
ance with the provisions of the rules in 
this part may be granted for a limited 
time, but only after the Commission 
has made a preliminary determination 
with respect to the factors set forth in 
this paragraph, as each case may re-
quire. This procedure also applies to 
any application that involves use of a 
frequency which is not in accordance 
with the provisions of the rules in this 
part, although in accordance with the 
Table of Frequency Allocations con-
tained in part 2 of this chapter. (An ap-
plication which involves use of a fre-
quency which is not in accordance with 
the Table of Frequency Allocations in 
part 2 of this chapter should be filed in 
accordance with the provisions of part 
5 of this chapter, Experimental Radio 
Services.) The factors with respect to 
which the Commission will make a pre-
liminary determination before acting 
on an application filed under this para-
graph are as follows: 

(1) That the public interest, conven-
ience or necessity warrants consider-
ation of the establishment of the pro-
posed service or the use of the proposed 
frequency; 

(2) That the proposed operation ap-
pears to warrant consideration to ef-
fect a change in the provisions of the 
rules in this part; and/or 

(3) That some operational data 
should be developed for consideration 
in any rule making proceeding which 
may be initiated. 

(b) Applications for stations that are 
intended to be used in the development 
of a proposed service must be accom-
panied by a petition to amend the Com-
mission’s rules with respect to fre-
quencies and such other items as may 
be necessary to provide for the regular 
establishment of the proposed service. 

§ 101.409 Terms of grant; general limi-
tations. 

(a) Developmental authorizations 
normally will be issued for one year, or 
such shorter term as the Commission 
may deem appropriate in any par-

ticular case, and will be subject to can-
cellation without hearing by the Com-
mission at any time upon notice to the 
licensee. 

(b) Where some phases of the develop-
mental program are not covered by the 
general rules of the Commission or by 
the rules of this part, the Commission 
may specify supplemental or additional 
requirements or conditions in each 
case as it may deem necessary in the 
public interest, convenience or neces-
sity. 

(c) Frequencies allocated to the serv-
ice toward which such development is 
directed will be assigned for develop-
mental operation on the basis that no 
interference will be caused to the reg-
ular services of stations operating in 
accordance with the Commission’s 
Table of Frequency Allocations (§ 2.106 
of this chapter). 

(d) The rendition of communication 
service for hire is not permitted under 
any developmental authorizations un-
less specifically authorized by the 
Commission. 

(e) The grant of a developmental au-
thorization carries with it no assur-
ance that the developmental program, 
if successful, will be authorized on a 
permanent basis either as to the serv-
ice involved or the use of the fre-
quencies assigned or any other fre-
quencies. 

§ 101.411 Supplementary showing re-
quired. 

(a) Authorizations for development of 
a proposed radio service in the services 
included in this part will be issued only 
upon a showing that the applicant has 
a definite program of research and de-
velopment, the details of which must 
be set forth, which has reasonable 
promise of substantial contribution to 
these services within the term of such 
authorization. A specific showing 
should be made as to the factors which 
qualify the applicant technically to 
conduct the research and development 
program, including a description of the 
nature and extent of engineering facili-
ties that the applicant has available 
for such purposes. 

(b) Expiring developmental author-
izations may be renewed only upon the 
applicant’s compliance with the appli-
cable requirements of § 101.413 (a) and 
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