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documentation) tending to show that 
such carrier engaged in an unauthor-
ized change of the subscriber’s pre-
ferred carrier; a statement of whether 
the complainant has paid any disputed 
charges to the allegedly unauthorized 
carrier; and the specific relief sought. 

(c) Procedure. The Commission will 
resolve slamming complaints under the 
definitions and procedures established 
in §§ 64.1100 through 64.1190 of this chap-
ter. The Commission will issue a writ-
ten (or electronic) order informing the 
complainant, the unauthorized carrier, 
and the authorized carrier of its find-
ing, and ordering the appropriate rem-
edy, if any, as defined by §§ 64.1160 
through 64.1170 of this chapter. 

(d) Unsatisfied Informal Complaints 
Involving Unauthorized Changes of a 
Subscriber’s Preferred Carrier; Formal 
Complaints Relating Back to the Fil-
ing Dates of Informal Complaints. If 
the complainant is unsatisfied with the 
resolution of a complaint under this 
section, the complainant may file a 
formal complaint with the Commission 
in the form specified in § 1.721. Such fil-
ing will be deemed to relate back to 
the filing date of the informal com-
plaint filed under this section, so long 
as the informal complaint complied 
with the requirements of paragraph (b) 
of this section and provided that: The 
formal complaint is filed within 45 days 
from the date an order resolving the in-
formal complaint filed under this sec-
tion is mailed or delivered electroni-
cally to the complainant; makes ref-
erence to both the informal complaint 
number assigned to and the initial date 
of filing the informal complaint filed 
under this section; and is based on the 
same cause of action as the informal 
complaint filed under this section. If 
no formal complaint is filed within the 
45–day period, the complainant will be 
deemed to have abandoned its right to 
bring a formal complaint regarding the 
cause of action at issue. 

[65 FR 47690, Aug. 3, 2000] 

FORMAL COMPLAINTS 

§ 1.720 General pleading requirements. 
Formal complaint proceedings are 

generally resolved on a written record 
consisting of a complaint, answer, and 
joint statement of stipulated facts, dis-

puted facts and key legal issues, along 
with all associated affidavits, exhibits 
and other attachments. Commission 
proceedings may also require or permit 
other written submissions such as 
briefs, written interrogatories, and 
other supplementary documents or 
pleadings. Those formal complaint pro-
ceedings handled on the Enforcement 
Bureau’s Accelerated Docket are sub-
ject to pleading and procedural rules 
that differ in some respects from the 
general rules for formal complaint pro-
ceedings. 

(a) Pleadings must be clear, concise, 
and explicit. All matters concerning a 
claim, defense or requested remedy, in-
cluding damages, should be pleaded 
fully and with specificity. 

(b) Pleadings must contain facts 
which, if true, are sufficient to con-
stitute a violation of the Act or Com-
mission order or regulation, or a de-
fense to such alleged violation. 

(c) Facts must be supported by rel-
evant documentation or affidavit. 

(d) Legal arguments must be sup-
ported by appropriate judicial, Com-
mission, or statutory authority. 

(e) Opposing authorities must be dis-
tinguished. 

(f) Copies must be provided of all 
non-Commission authorities relied 
upon which are not routinely available 
in national reporting systems, such as 
unpublished decisions or slip opinions 
of courts or administrative agencies. 

(g) Parties are responsible for the 
continuing accuracy and completeness 
of all information and supporting au-
thority furnished in a pending com-
plaint proceeding. Information sub-
mitted, as well as relevant legal au-
thorities, must be current and updated 
as necessary and in a timely manner at 
any time before a decision is rendered 
on the merits of the complaint. 

(h) Specific reference shall be made 
to any tariff provision relied on in sup-
port of a claim or defense. Copies of 
relevant tariffs or relevant portions of 
tariffs that are referred to or relied 
upon in a complaint, answer, or other 
pleading shall be appended to such 
complaint, answer, or other pleading. 

(i) All statements purporting to sum-
marize or explain Commission orders 
or policies must cite, in standard legal 
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form, the Commission ruling upon 
which such statements are based. 

(j) Pleadings shall identify the name, 
address, telephone number, and fac-
simile transmission number for either 
the filing party’s attorney or, where a 
party is not represented by an attor-
ney, the filing party. 

[53 FR 11852, Apr. 11, 1988, as amended at 58 
FR 25572, Apr. 27, 1993; 63 FR 1035, Jan. 7, 
1998; 63 FR 41446, Aug. 4, 1998; 64 FR 60725, 
Nov. 8, 1999] 

§ 1.721 Format and content of com-
plaints. 

(a) Subject to paragraph (e) of this 
section governing supplemental com-
plaints filed pursuant to § 1.722, and 
paragraph (f) of this section governing 
Accelerated Docket proceedings, a for-
mal complaint shall contain: 

(1) The name of each complainant 
and defendant; 

(2) The occupation, address and tele-
phone number of each complainant 
and, to the extent known, each defend-
ant; 

(3) The name, address, and telephone 
number of complainant’s attorney, if 
represented by counsel; 

(4) Citation to the section of the 
Communications Act and/or order and/ 
or regulation of the Commission al-
leged to have been violated. 

(5) A complete statement of facts 
which, if proven true, would constitute 
such a violation. All material facts 
must be supported, pursuant to the re-
quirements of § 1.720(c) and paragraph 
(a)(11) of this section, by relevant affi-
davits and documentation, including 
copies of relevant written agreements, 
offers, counter-offers, denials, or other 
related correspondence. The statement 
of facts shall include a detailed expla-
nation of the manner and time period 
in which a defendant has allegedly vio-
lated the Act, Commission order, or 
Commission rule in question, including 
a full identification or description of 
the communications, transmissions, 
services, or other carrier conduct com-
plained of and the nature of any injury 
allegedly sustained by the complain-
ant. Assertions based on information 
and belief are expressly prohibited un-
less made in good faith and accom-
panied by an affidavit explaining the 
basis for the plaintiff’s belief and why 

the complainant could not reasonably 
ascertain the facts from the defendant 
or any other source; 

(6) Proposed findings of fact, conclu-
sions of law, and legal analysis rel-
evant to the claims and arguments set 
forth in the complaint; 

(7) The relief sought, including recov-
ery of damages and the amount of dam-
ages claimed, if known; 

(8) Certification that the complain-
ant has, in good faith, discussed or at-
tempted to discuss the possibility of 
settlement with each defendant prior 
to the filing of the formal complaint. 
Such certification shall include a 
statement that, prior to the filing of 
the complaint, the complainant mailed 
a certified letter outlining the allega-
tions that form the basis of the com-
plaint it anticipated filing with the 
Commission to the defendant carrier or 
one of the defendant’s registered 
agents for service of process that in-
vited a response within a reasonable 
period of time and a brief summary of 
all additional steps taken to resolve 
the dispute prior to the filing of the 
formal complaint. If no additional 
steps were taken, such certificate shall 
state the reason(s) why the complain-
ant believed such steps would be fruit-
less; 

(9) Whether a separate action has 
been filed with the Commission, any 
court, or other government agency 
that is based on the same claim or 
same set of facts, in whole or in part, 
or whether the complaint seeks pro-
spective relief identical to the relief 
proposed or at issue in a notice-and- 
comment proceeding that is concur-
rently before the Commission; 

(10) An information designation con-
taining: 

(i) The name, address, and position of 
each individual believed to have first-
hand knowledge of the facts alleged 
with particularity in the complaint, 
along with a description of the facts 
within any such individual’s knowl-
edge; 

(ii) A description of all documents, 
data compilations and tangible things 
in the complainant’s possession, cus-
tody, or control, that are relevant to 
the facts alleged with particularity in 
the complaint. Such description shall 
include for each document: 
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